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.------EDITORIAL---------. 
The recent award of the architectural 
commission for the Chancery In 
Washington to Arthur Erlckson 
dominated both the Informal and the 
official discussion of the 1982 Royal 
Architectural Institute of Canada's 
Assembly In Winnipeg. lt Is not the first 
time that the commission for a major 
government project has sparked con· 
troversy or scandal. Because of the 
very nature of such a decision, lt will 
probably not be the last time either. 
The fact Is that there were a lot of 
angry architects gathered together In 
Winnipeg. 

it must be clearly understood that the 
selection process employed for the 
Washington Chancery project was 
competitive, but not a competition In 
the usual way. Any registered architec· 
tural firm In Canada Interested In par­
ticipating was asked to register and 
subsequently complete a question­
naire with regard to their suitability for 
such a project. The Selection Panel, 
composed of members of the Depart· 
ments of External Affairs and Public 
Works as well as two representatives 
of the RAIC, met and established a list 
of eleven firms chosen for further con­
sideration. Representatives of these 
firms took part In a site visit and brief· 
lngs In Washington and then made 
presentations and were Interviewed by 
the Selection Panel. The Panel deter­
mined that one firm was clearly the 
first choice for the commission (Zeldler 
Roberts Partnership) and three other 
firms were also recommended to the 
government (Morlyama & Teshlma, 
Moshe Safdie I Desnoyers Mercure I 
Larose Laliberte Petrucci, and Smith 
Carter Partners). Almost three months 
later, the Prime Minister announced 
the decision to award the commission 
to the firm of Arthur Erlckson, one of 
the eleven firms Interviewed but not 
one of the four firms recommended by 
the Panel. 

The selection of Arthur Erlckson would 
not normally seem so unusual. His 
reputation In Canada and lnterna· 
tlonaily Is constantly being reinforced, 
notably by his recent appointment to 
direct the planning of the Bunker Hill 
redevelopment In Los Angeles. He Is 
easily capable of providing a compe­
tent solution. The prestigious pro· 
gramme and budget would seem to be 
consistent with Erickson's approach to 
architecture. But his Washington 
Chancery will always be a scarred 
monument, another milestone In the 
already unhealthy situation of the ar­
chitectural competition In Canada. 

The selection of an architectural taam 
for such an Important public building 
Is bound to cause debate · competl· 
lions by their very nature are cumber­
some and controversial. The selection 
process used In the case of the 
Washington Chancery seemed promls· 
lng In Its simplicity and objectiveness 

but may be so maligned now that 11 can 
no longer be seriously pursued. 
Municipal competitions in the past few 
years have also resulted In skepticism 
and disappointment around the ar­
chitectural community. Instead of hav­
Ing established a democratic process 
to produce the best possible building 
by the most suitable architect, we have 
arrived at a situation In which only a 
small handful, and usually the same 
handful of architects can qualify for 
projects of major significance. The 
result, underlined by the Erlckson 
case, Is that the competitive process 
Itself seems trivial, Inconsequential 
and redundant. 
1t Is now up to the architectural com· 
munlty to convince itself, its clients 
and the public In general that the 
benefits of a competition outweigh the 
burden. Spurred on by the Erickson 
issue, the RAIC has decided to 
establish guidelines for competitions 
in Canada at both the public and 
private levels. it Is unfortunate that the 
skeptlcism now rampant in the proles· 
slon has made the recent lean years all 
the more discouraging for the practice. 
Younger architects and students have 
to be able to believe that an open com­
petition will truly provide them with an 
opportunity to compete on an equal 
basis with the established firms. 
Denied that opportunity, we are depriv­
Ing the public of new ideas and, 
ultimately, better buildings. 

The Erlckson issue is certainly a low 
point in canadian architectural prac· 
tlce. it has brought to a head the anger 
and frustration of the profession fueil· 
ed by the failure of recent competl· 
lions. We can blame our government 
for Irresponsibly ignoring the recom· 
mendatlons of the Selection Panel that 
they appointed. We can blame Arthur 
Erlckson for accepting the commission 
without regard for the circumvention of 
the selection process and the resulting 
controversy. But, we must also blame 
ourselves, the architectural communi· 
ty. We have watched the competition 
In Canada decline and have accepted 
the situation with a shrug and some 
comment about the 'realities' of the 
profession. Had the concern so evident 
In Winnipeg this May been expressed 
much earlier, the government may not 
have been so casual with its commis· 
slons, Erickson not so riQhteous about 
his appointment and the profession 
not so skeptlcal about Its practice. 

The Mlsslssauga City Hall competition 
Is now approaching, the winner to be 
announced In October. The profession 
Is viewing it with airs of both expect an· 
cy and cynicism. A British Columbia ar· 
chltect returned his Invitation to enter 
the competition signed "No con· 
f/dence ... see Washington, D.C. Com· 
petition". I hope he changes his mind. I 
hope we all do. 

(Mark Poddubluk). 
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by Orest J . Humennyj 

Strathcona Hall, the original Young 
Mens' Christian ASSOCiation of McGil 
Univers•ty, dates back to 1904-05 (see 
Archives photograph on last page). 
Designed by Montreal architects 
Finiey and Spence and funded by Lord 
Strathcona. the Governor and principal 
benefactor of McGill University, 
Strathcona Hall was a landmark for 
e•ght decades. Its carefully detailed 
Sherbrooke Street facade, In a cream 
co:oured sandstone, contrasted sharp­
ry with Its finely crafted beige-brick 
s1de elevations. 1t was perhaps the 
ftnest example of that Montreal ar­
chitecture tradition whicr has ex­
asperated many a sophisticated 
observer. 

Strathcona Hall is gone now, demo sh­
ed in lale June of this year desp te 
assurances that it would be preserved 
and Integrated into the new Devencore 
complex designed by architects Dav1d, 
Boulva, Cleve. DesPite the fact that 
structural problems In the old building 
were apparent years ago, evident even 
to tne most untrained eye (particularly 
with respect to its McGill College 
Avenue elevation), insurmountable 
structural dirrlculties (rotten wooden 
piles and leanmg steel structure) are 
cited as the reasons for the demolition 
ot this venerable edif1ce. 

Yes, the stone facade was carefully 
dismounted, numbered, and will be re­
erected: a queer sort of contextualism 
with respect to the token preservation 
of several grey-stone facades next 
door. In fact, it's pomtedly s1mpier to 
archltecturally deal w1th the integra­
lion of a mere facade rather than of a 
whole bulldmg Into any new complex 
lt all leads to a rather surreal•stic v. 
slon of tne Developer, the Contractor 
and the Architect sitting around on a 
Sunday afternoon and having tea. and 
upon "suddenly" learning of the "new­
ly discovered" structural difficulties, 
shouting in un1son w1th a cumulative 
glee: " Waste it!'' 

(Orest J. Hvmenny1 IS a former Ed1tor 
of THE FIFTH COLUMN). 

' INTERNATIONAL STYLE AT HARVARD 
by Paul Falconer 

A major architectural event took place 
this spring when the Harvard Graduate 
School of Design sponsored an exhibi· 
lion and a two-<! ay conference to mark 
the 50th anniversary of the Museum of 
Modern Art's "Modern Architecture: In­
ternational Exhibition" mounted by 
Henry-Russell Hltchcock and Philip 
Johnson in 1932. The exhibition which 
accompanied the lecture series 
highlighted the 1932 show at MoMA. 
which subsequently travelled to major 
galleries throughout the United States. 
The 1982 exhibition was divided into 
three parts. with the first focusing on 
the work of nine architects, including 
Waiter Gropius, Le Corbusier, J.J.P. 
Oud andMiesvanderRohe,allofwhom 
were featured in the 1932 show. The se· 
cond part documented the reception 
the show received as it travelled 
across the country, while the final part 
exp ored the dispersion of the lnterna· 
tiona Style around the world. 

The Conference and Exhibition 
brought together an interesting array 
of noted architects, historians and 
critics. The Panel discussions which 
followed the paper presentations in­
cluded the likes of Richard Meier, 
Bruno Zevi, Peter Eisenman, Paul 
Rudolph, Phllip Johnson and Lewis 
Mumford. all of whom gathered in an 
attempt to examine the circumstances 
surrounding the 1932 exhibition and to 
assess how the complex issues then 
raised have been played out in the ar· 
chltecture of the last f<tty years. 

THE FIFTH COLUMN as a national 
journal Is calling for increased par­
ticipation throughout the country and 
beyond Whether from student, profes­
sional or otherwise, material Is hoped 
for and needed to raise the level of 
quality and broaden the appeal of the 
magazine. Articles can be thematic or 
of general Interest. Jt Is now our policy 
to publish potential future themes well 
In advance In order to better solicit 
submiss1ons. Some of these proposed 
themes are: Rational Architecture, 
PolitiCS in Architecture, Utopianism, 
Anthropomorphism, Ornamentation, 
Geometry, Suburb1a, and Architects 10 
Canada. 

With their book and exhibition, Hit· 
chcock and John son Intended not only 
to indicate what the new style was, but 
to show that lt was being adopted 
throughout the world. Despite this em­
phasis on the International nature of 
the work, they managed to assemble a 
collection of buildings which were 
diverse In their principles, each one be­
ing designed by an Individual architect 
who obviously had his own preoccupa­
tions and understanding of architec­
ture, and thus national and even local 
characteristics came through quite 
clearly. Hltchcock and Johnson were 
in fact discussing only one part o f a 
broader phenonmenon, and their 
catalogue and exhibition were less 
than Ideal surveys of modern architec­
ture in 1932. Other comtemporary ac­
counts of the movement were much 
more comprehensive, and they 
demonstrated that modern architec­
ture was more diverse and was being 
adopted in places that Hitchcock and 
Johnson had failed to notice or 
neglected to mention. 

Although Henry-Russell Hitchcock and 
Philip Johnson may not have defined 
it, it is difficult to deny that at one level 
or anther an "International Style" did 
exist. The popularity and p'3rsistence 
of the term indicates a general 
understanding that an important 
crystallization of thought did take 
place in the 1 and early 1930's. 

THE FIFTH COLUMN dans sa role de 
revue d'envergure natlonale encourage 
la participation a !ravers le pays at au· 
dela soit etudiant, professional, ou 
autre. Les soumisslons sont 
necessa1re pour augmenter le nlveau 
de la quahte du magazine. Les articles 
soumls peuvent etre thematlque ou 
d'lnteret general. Desormals nous 
publierons les themes proposees blen 
en avance pour que les ecrivains au 
large peuvent etre tenu au courant et, 
nous esperons, etre inspire. Les 
themes proposees en ce moment sont: 
I' Architecture Rationale, La Polltlque 
et !'Architecture, I'Utopianlsme, I'An· 
thropomorphlsme, !'Ornamentation, la 
Geometrie, les Banlieues, et les Ar· 
chitectes du Canada. 
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The winners of the first annual RAIC 
Students of Architecture Design Com­
petition were recently announced at 
the RAIC Assembly In Winnipeg. 
Stating that none of the entries met Its 
level of expectation, the jury decided 
that there should be no first prize and 
Instead awarded three prizes of 
$500.00 and two merit awards of 
$250.00 each. 

The three prize winners were Eugene 
Daniels of the Technical University of 
Nova Scotla, Tim G. Walsh of the 
Regina RAIC Syllabus program, and 
James Lee, also of T.U.N.S. The two 
merit awards went to Jean Maltais of 
Universite Laval and to the team of 
Phllip Fenech and John Fraser of 
Waterloo University. 

The jury consisted of Helga Plumb 
(M.Arch), Toronto architect and Ad· 
junct Associate Professor at Waterloo; 
Etienne J. Gaboury (B.Arch), Winnipeg 
architect; Jerry F. Wesetake, Assistant 
Professor, University of Manitoba 
Dept. of Interior Design; and Stephen 

Cohlmeyer (B.Arch), architect. In Its 
general comments it stated that: "the 
three prize winning submissions were 
all done in a professional manner 
although they did not seem to rise into 
the more creative aspects of architec­
ture .... lt was thought that school was 
the time to test out the limits of 
creativity, yet the students In the com­
petition did not go beyond solving the 
more functiona l problems of the pro· 
ject . Regretably those that did show 
the creative spark did not also 
demonstrate an architectural rigor." 

Although only 22 entries were even­
tually received by the jury, over 150 
students initially regi!!"tered in the com­
petition, sponsored by Alcan and the 
RAIC College of Fellows, and whose 
program was to redesign two rail cars 
into a travelling design studio. En­
couraged by the obvious interest in a 
national contest, the RAIC Students of 
Architecture plan to hold another com­
petition In Fall 1982, and will structure 
the program and the deadlines in order 
to improve both the quality and the 
quantity of submissions. 

COHOS EVAMY TRAVELLING SCHOLARSHIP (NATIONAL) 

The winner M the first annual Cohos 
Evamy & Partners Travell ing Scholar­
ship is Franc;ois Brillant of Laval 
University with Caleton's Wynus 
Bielaska a close runner-up. The single 
prize of $8000.00 awarded to Brillant, is 
Intended to fund a graduating student 
In a Canadian School of Architecture 
to a 12 week period of study and obser­
vation In the sponsor's office, followed 
by an unrestricted period of travel. 

Each of the ten Schools was asked to 
select two candidates, whose port· 
folios were then evaluated by a jury 
consisting of Davld Russell (B. Arch), 
Alberta Minister of Health, Dale Taylor 
(B. Arch), Professor at the University of 
Calgary and Martin Cohos (B. Arch), 
partner In the sponsoring firm. Follow­
Ing are excepts from the jury's general 
comments: 

"The maturity and excellence of the 
submissions reinforces our faith In to· 
day's educational system . . . Both 
poets and builders became evident; 
this Is good for our profession. Once 
we had narrowed down the entries to 
the final two top contenders, our job 
became very difficult. Trying to read 
behind the widely differing styles of 
presentation folios ... was a real 
challenge." (Russell) 

" ..• the dominating social questions of 
a few years ago are giving to a more 
narrow Post-modernism and 'academic 

historicism' (usually In inverse propor­
tion to the air fare from Princeton to 
the school in question) ... Students 
seem to value drawing again (thank 
goodness)". (Taylor) 

"Excellent overall level of work; gives 
one great confidence for the future of 
architecture and urban design; the 
schools to be congratulated; the 
students applauded. The final choice 
between the two top entries was par­
ticularly di fficult." (Cohos) 

Franc;ois Brillant will be starting his 12 
week internship in Calgary on July 2, 
after which he plans to travel to 
Switzerland to study the nee­
rationalist architects of Tessin (La 
Tendenza, Marlo Botta, and others) 
and hopes to work with them. If his 
funds hold out, he will also visit the 
works of Carlo Scarpa In Italy and meet 
his architect son, Tobla Scarpa. Upon 
his return In March 1983, Brlllant will 
produce a report on his experiences for 
publication. 

Wynus Blelaska Intends to work for an 
architect with similar sensitivities. sen­
sibilities and joy for the design for ar­
chitecture. Although his school ex­
periences were very Inspirational, he 
now wants to learn the conventions of 
office practice, Employed by the Thorn 
Partnership In past summers, Blelaska 
Is now temporarily working for his ar­
chitect father In Toronto. 
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En fran~als, s'll Vous Plait! 

J'al pris contact avec votre revue en 
juillet derniere a Montreal ou Je m'etais 
rendu en vacances. A cette occasion je 
me suis abonne a votre excellente 
revue. Depuis je suls rentre en France 
et j'al fait abonner mon ecole, celle de 
Clermont Ferrand. En ce qu i concerne 
votre revue Je n'avais qu'un souhait a 
formuler: c'est de pouvoir lire plus sou­
vent des art icles en franc;ais. Vous n'ig­
norez pas que l'enseignement des 
langues est tres deficient en France et 
done qu'il nous est difficile d'aborder 
des art icles rediges entierement en 
anglais, avec ie vocabulaire et les tour· 
nures des phrases complexes qui 
characterisent le milieu architectural. 
Precedent cette lettre j'ai envoye un 
mandat correspondant a mon reabon­
nement pour un an. 

Amicalement votre, 
Alain Jouanisson, 
Romagnat, France. 

Cher lecteur, 
Cela a ete la politique de THE FIFTH 
COLUMN de publie des articles soit en 
anglais ou en franc;als, les deux 
langues officiels du Canada. 11 y a eu 
dans la passe au moins un article 
franc;ais dans chaque numero et ~a 
continuera aussi iongtemps que possi­
ble. Par contre les articles en franc;ais 
ont ete llmlte en nombre parce que les 
sousmissions en francais oot ete 
limits. Peut-6tre, Alaln, comme notre 
correspondant en France, tu vas en­
courage des articles franc;als prove­
nant de ton cote de I'Atlantique. Nean­
molns, nous invltons nos lecteurs fran­
cophones de nOtre cote de l'ocean des 
s'impliquer encore plus dans la debat 
architecturale. 

Comlte de Redaction. 
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TWO REVIEWS· THE PERCY E. NOBBS EXHIBITION 
by John Bland 

The exhibition, Percy Ersklne Nobbs: 
Architect, Artist, Craftsman, at Mon· 
treat's McCord Museum until July and 
prepared by Susan Wagg from draw­
Ings, photographs, and papers held In 
the Canadian Architecture Collection 
and by the members or his family, Is a 
great account of a key flgure in earlier 
20th·Century architecture of Canada. 

While the exhibition sets memorable 
standards In the presentation of the 
wor of an architect, lt will llke'y be 
survived Dy the handsome and lnfor· 
matlve monograph Mrs. Wagg nas wnt­
ten to accompany lt. Both are the 
result of careful research and a sym· 
pathetic appreciation of Nobbs' objec· 
tlves, and tt Is In this respect that her 
wor. Is lmortant for persons puzzled by 
architectural objectl'>'es today. 

The drawings in the exhibition deserve 
close examination because Nobbs was 
an outstanding draughtsman. The 
photographs of his works need to be 
studied too, to appreciate how Nobbs 
used good materials and neat con­
struction, and always related his 
buildings to their surroundings. Items 
of furniture, decorative plaster, as well 
as plaster models for stone cutters. 
metal work, stained glass and 
delightful sketches show that Nobbs 
was an 'arts and cra'ts arch ;a;t' of 
skill and commlttment. But to unders­
tand his background. his objectives, 
the basis of his creative Imagination, 
his humanity and tne meaning of his 
being eal ed an 'Inspired traditionalist' 
one must read Mrs. Wagg's text where 
these matters have been explored. 

Nobbs belonged to a generation of 
British architects splntually allied to 
Wllliam Morris, the poet and social 
reformer, who believed that factories 
and factory attitudes had not only 
disrupted society, but had destroyed 

the m nor arts Morris devoted h1msell, 
wlth others, to the revival of craftsman­
ship. Beginning with the arts and 
crafts of building, he explored nearly 
all the decorative arts Including prin· 
ling and book-making, In which he was 
specially Influential. He was believed 
when he pointed out that the creative 
imagination and sound judgement of 
craftsmen, based upon their 
knowledge of material, the tools they 
used, and their joy In work, was what 
the factory system had destroyed. He 
regarded the anonymous factory 
worker, hired to use equipment he 
could never own, to follow instructions 
he need not understand, likely to pro· 
duce only a part of something, as be· 
lng without dlgmty or satisfaction. 
While the story Is complex. to be brief 
11 can be said that In late 19th-Century 
England, where many things were 
made skill fully, there was a difficulty In 
making things beautiful that had of­
fered no problem In the 18th-Century. 
The exception to the rule occurred 
where traditional craftsmanship had 
been revived, especially In the con­
struction and furnishing of decorative 
buildings, which was work that In all 
cases could be traced back to Willlam 
Morris. An architecture of great pro· 
mise had come to be based on an ap· 
preclation of material and the ap­
propnate techniques, on regional con­
siderations, effects of weathering and 
the feelmgs such matters convey· con­
cerns given scanty considerations by 
designers whose compositions 
depended mainly upon rout ne 
histoncal revival, reason or geometry. 
Th1s Involvement with craftsmanship 
led to a special appreclat1on of the 
splendid examples surviving from the 
past, whether Surrey farm houses or 
magnificent works In London. British 
arts and crafts architects could not 
escape be1ng traditionalists, whereas 
their American counterparts working 
without such examples at hand, could 
be and were more experimental. For 
the same reason the creative Imagina­
tion of British tra1ned architects tend· 
ed to Images drawn from national ex­
perience. So lt was with Nobbs. when 
he was required to imagine the conver· 
slon of an austere anatomy laboratory 
Into a special library to rece1ve Willlam 
Osier's extraordinary beQuest to 
McGIII University • his books, papers 
and his ashes • matenal that almost 
dally would be visited by scholars from 
universities around the world, Images 
of splended British university libraries 
came to his mind, and he designed a 
room that could be an adjunct of any of 
them. lt would never have occured to 
him to make it art-deco or to make any 
such arbitrary choice. 

THE FIFTH COLUMN, Summer 1982 

Nobbs never hes itated to use 
precedents In his work. That Is not to 
say that he copied, as Is so greatly 
feared by persons Intent upon being 
creative. But he saw a good deal of ar­
chitecture as performance, and bellev· 
ed 1t was his duty to know what had 
been done before in the area of solving 
a particular problem, In order to find a 
solution that would be as nice as 
possible In the circumstances. For 
Nobbs, design was a continual search 
for form, starting with an understan· 
dlng of what was required and a ten­
tative proposal related to local cir­
cumstances to be modified by a con· 
sideration of materials and how they 
would be assembled for durability and 
expression, and finally what ornament 
might be added to make the work a joy. 

Nobbs loved nature and saw it as a 
system of forces to which plants and 
animals responded and architects ig· 
nored at their peril. This awareness of 
nature limited choices and helped to 
remove the curse of arbitrariness in 
design. There were lessons for ar· 
chltects In the way a cat stretches out 
In the sun and curls up in the cold. He 
enjoyed the way native people shaped 
their canoes and showshoes in 
response to the materials used and the 
circumstances of their employment. 
He enjoyed the way ships were built to 
perform their tasks. and how farmers 
arranged their buildings in relation to 
sun and wind, and the needs of their 
animals. 

Drawing for Nobbs was the architect's 
means of thinking; experimenting on 
paper with possible arrangements: and 
finally conveying to a client what 
would be seen in the scale of the view 
chosen, which required great 
discrimination In the choice of lines 
and in the Indication of ornament. 

The Depression Interrupted Nobbs' 
practice and teaching. The arts and 
crafts movement did not evolve Into a 
vernacular architecture. Craftsmen, as 
other artists, depend upon the expen· 
diture of surplus wealth and their ex­
Istence Is precarious In the best of 
times. In the Great Depression, ar· 
chltecture ceased altogether and when 
archltecure began again, economy was 
the cry. 1t was naive to have expected 
more. Arts and crafts architecture had 
produced a number of exquisite works 
In which we can take pleasure but like 
other architectural movements it was a 
response to particular conditions 
which have now vanished. 

The disruption of Industrial society 
persisted and attention turned to other 
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remedial philosophies. In the area of 
architecture, Waiter Groplus emerged 
as spokesman for a common sense ap· 
proach to the acceptance of Industry 
and Its power for good as opposed to 
Morris' fears. Improvement of life's 
equipment, from teacups to highways, 
through simplification and efficiency 
and the rejection of decorative 
furbelows was a compelling argument. 
The new architecture offered Ideals of 
optimism and apparent effectiveness. 
Rational design could be the answer to 
industrialization of production. Fac· 
tories could have an Ideal environment. 
Trade unions would assure harmony 
and fairness In work. 

Modern architecture was to have been 
an attitude rather than a set of forms. 
Its objective was sensible buildings to 
obtain better living for people 
everywhere. Perhaps because ar· 
chltects are heardly ever called upon 
to make schemes for such Ideals but 
are In fact required to make specific 
plans for particular needs for clients 
who want to express their Importance, 
it was Inevitable that certain forms 
would arise to distinguish examples of 
the new architecture, forming a basis 
of comparison and competition. In 
time, these forms would become more 
Important than the original ideals. This 
appears to have happened and begs 
the reconsideration of objectives. This 
can well be given focus and desirable 
realism by reviewing work here In the 
first third of this century, In which 
Nobbs' objectives played an Important 
role, with that of the second In which 
they were superceded by others of 
equal seriousness. 
(John Blend Is Professor Emeritus at 
the School of Architecture at McG/11 
University). 

by Peter Scrlver 

Architecture Is coming of age In the 
North American consciousness If the 
rising voice of heritage societies and 
the chic 'consumablllty' of the ar· 
chltectural drawing, are any Indication. 
A more convincing example of the 
popular significance of such a move· 
ment, however, was the encouraging 
public Interest generated by the recent 
exhibition of the life and works of Per· 
cy Ersklne Nobbs at the McCord 
Museum In Montreal. The mounting of 
a complete show on a Canadian ar· 
chltect , let alone the topic of archltec· 
lure itself, Is somewhat of a milestone 
In this country. Its initial success has 
been secured In part. I believe. by Its 
presentation In a museum of Cultural 
heritage with an emphasis upon the ar· 
chltect as artisan and humanist, rather 
than the portrayal of the architect as 
artist that one would have expected 
from a gallery exhibition. 

The McCord showing was nicely 
enhanced for Montrealers by their 
familiarity with Nobbs' numerous In· 
stltutlonal and residential commis· 
slons In the city, virtually all of which 
have gracefully survived the ravages of 
urban renewal In the past few decades. 
The McCord Museum Itself occupies 
the former McGIII Student Union 
Building, the first of several 
distinguished grey-stones that Nobbs, 
one·tlme Director of McGill's School of 
Architecture, designed for the universl· 
ty over the years. However, the exhibl· 
tion is quite complete In Itself, with 
photographs beautifully mounted like 
all the exhibits, to supplement what 
can be seen In the streets of Montreal 
Care has been taken to categorize, and 
gro~p esthetlcally a graphically rich 
feast of exhibits from crisp Ink presen· 
talion drawings to vibrant watercolour 
renderings, to knarled plaster maquet· 
tes for ornamental stone work; from a 
radiant back·llt stained-glass panel to 
a dark, hard-wood chair gripped In a 
schizoid tension between baronial 
comfort and botanical contorslons. 
The Inclusion of the some fiery angling 
' flys ' of Nobbs ' creation along with the 
crossed foils of his allied passion for 
fencing fill out this visually enchanting 
show which speaks as much of a 
fascinating man as it does of his work. 
As was also well exploited by the re· 
cent landmark exhibit ion of Sir Edwin 
Lutyens at London's Hayward Gallery 
the character and humanity of the 
designer as expressed In his work is 
ultimately the force which com· 
munlcates to the public and wins their 
deeper appreciation and Involvement 
In the architecture. 
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Nobbs was not a great artist nor did he 
appear to suffer any such delusions. 
Rather his work reveals a highly skilled 
and spirited artisan: Innovative, quirky, 
and even (dare we say) 'mannered' but 
tempered always by the reassurance of 
tradltionnal forms and materials. The 
Scott House In Dorval, Quebec, is a 
marvelous example of these qualities. 
In his best work, generally the smaller 
residential designs and the larger but 
Intimately contextual McGIII buildings, 
Nobbs triumphs In the architectural 
moldlng of form to both the natural 
and the built landscape, exhibiting in 
all an uncanny penchant for what ap· 
peals and surprises instinctively rather 
than what shocks and challenges 
esthetically. Such grace and con· 
fidence of design seems somehow 
lacking In his more monumental 
designs such as the University Alberta 
buildings and his war memorial pro· 
)eels which sit ponderous and uncom· 
fortable In their naked, formal lscia· 
!Ion. 

Nobbs' work began as that 01 a 
Scotsman, dist inct from the American 
Influences which so powerfully charc· 
terlzed architecture In early 20th· 
Century Canada. But as a Canadian of 
choice and obvious passion, and as an 
architect committed to a highly 
responsive approach to environment 
and context. Nobbs' work clearly came 
to speak what should confidently be 
called a ·canadian' architecture. Well 
beyond the now undiscrlminatlngly 
popular nostalgia for canada's surviv· 
lng 19th·Century ·Gas-Towns' and col· 
onlal 'vleux quartlers', the popularity of 
the Nobbs exhibition makes a rich and 
convincing testament to the maturity, 
dignity, and permanence of at least 
some 'Architecture' of this country, 
and of this century, notwithstanding! 
This first by the McCord will hopefully 
spawn similarly delightful discoveries 
In future, bOth of Architecture and of 
architectural characters slumbering In 
the musty wood·work of our rather pro· 
udlsh heritage. Percy Erskln Nobbs: Ar· 
chlteet, Artist, Craftsman w 11 travel to 
the Ring House Gallery of the 
University of Alberta 111 October, to the 
Nickel Art Gallery at the UntversJty of 
Calgary In January and finally to the 
Agnes Etherlngton Arts' Centre at 
Queen's University in March of next 
year 
(Peter Scrtver Is a student at the 
School of Architecture at McG/11 
University). 
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• 

by Brian R. Sinclair 

C 
onferences are usually a time 
v;hen people can get together 
and have some fun and ex-

change Information. The Royal Ar­
chitectual Institute of Canada's An­
nual Assembly In Winnipeg (May 
29-June 21 was Indeed an enjoyable 
social trip for the students attending, 
but of more 1mportance was the 
understaodmg that they took home 
with them when the conference was 
over. The conference provided an ex­
cellent opportunity for students to ge• 
togethef and talk oo,;er Issues ttla~ were 
of a common concern. 11 was reassur· 
ing to d1scover that all the students 
have s m1Jar problems, regardless of 
tile school they attend, and it was in· 
tefesting to see how students from the 
d flerent schools approached these 
problems 

One Issue that was of concern was the 
lack of communication that exists bet· 
ween the schools. This Jack of corn· 
munlcation results in students not 
understanding how other schools func· 
t1on, possibly creatmg a somewhat 
narrow-minded and opinionated view 
within any given schOol. Discussions 
about the problem brought about sug­
gestions on possible methods of ex· 
change of Ideas and works between 
the schOOls lt was generally accepted 
that a good med urn for exchange 
would be an exhibit or the ten Schools' 
works that would travel betv.een the 
Schools. This exhibitiOn would in· 
crease awareness about what is hap· 
penlng With student architecture In 
canada. The display of student work 
that was assembled for the 1982 RAIC 
Conference was a well represented 
sample of the ten Schools work, so it 
was suggested that lt be used as the 
travelling e)(hlbitlon. Plans for such an 
exhibition are now proceeding. 

The exchange of student works s a 
very necessary occurence yet 
students also realized the importance 
of a more Immediate channel to get 
their ideas out to other students and to 
the profession. THE FIFTH COLUMN 
provides such a channel, and students 
seemed optimistic about this journal. 
THE FIFTH COLUMN provides the 
medium through which students can 
get their ideas out to others. rather 
than restricting these ideas to the 
rather narrow aud1ence of the r school. 
The Injection of new materia into THE 
FIFTH COLUMN from students across 
Canada has significant potential, for 1t 
i s by such exposure that Ideas can be 
tested aod cnticlsm voiced. Dunng 
d1scusslons we realized that there are 
not enough students utilizing this 
channel of communication yet one can 
only hope that this problem arises 
from a lack of awareness rather than 
from student apathy. From my obser· 
vatlons at these meetings, I believe 
that students do want to voice their 
ideas and exchange Information. The 
use of THE FIFTH COLUMN for this 
purpose must be encouraged. 
Communication among students is 
very Important, and during the con­
ference there were many round-table 
dtscussions that resulted in many pro· 
blems being more well understood. The 
social events were a!so Important as 
they allowed us to get to know one 
another without the barriers that seem 
to exist In more formal meetings. 
Another Instrument of communication, 
and one that I think is extremely impor­
tant to students, IS the profession's 
liaison wlth our student group. My im­
pressions of the student-profession 
relationship was ~ery positive. This 
relationship, at the conference, ranged 
from Interaction at meetings to lnfor· 
mallon functions. The student tour of 

THE FIFTH COLUMN, Summer 1982 

St. Bonlface and Paroisse du Precieux 
Sang by Et1enne Gaboury was a good 
example of Informal communication. l 
believe I am speaking for all the 
students Involved, in saying that this 
trip was most Interesting and lnfor· 
matrve. Students can benefit greatly 
through the experience and involve­
ment of dedicated architects such as 
Etlenne. 

The RAIC Student Competition (Rail 
Car Design) was another issue review· 
ed at the meetings. lt was thought that 
the submissions were too technical 
with little creat1v1ty Involved. Perhaps 
this technical interpretation was the 
result of a program which did not pro­
mote freedom In thinking, or possibly it 
was due to the technical aspect of the 
subject Itself. The graphically 
technical layout of the program 
booklet may also have contributed to 
this lack of creative expression. The 
RAIC Student Competition provides an 
opportunity for students to get lnvolv· 
ed with architecture on a national 
scale. 11 provides a chance for 
students to work on a common pro· 
blem, and through this to learn about 
and from others. This competition was 
a first , and as such was open to a 
myriad of problems. Given the 
obstacles I must commend Keith Ben­
)amln of the University of Calgary for 
such a professional job In his organiz· 
ing the competition. In Keith's discus­
sions with the other students it was 
decided that what should be presented 
In upcoming competitions should be a 
less structured program, perhaps as 
simple as a one·llne statement of the 
subject. A nalloilal competition, 
although concerned with technical 
ability should place as most Important 
the e~presslon of students' creative 
thought In problem-solving. 



The most emotional issue of the con­
ference was the Washington Chancery 
commission award that had recently 
gone to Arthur Erlckson. Students ex­
pressed their deep concern on this 
Issue, and at tfle RAIC General 
Meeting voiced this concern to the 
members of the profession. The 
students were disillusioned with the 
Government's decision which bypass­
ed the competition selection process. 
The students felt that the competition 
process is a fair one, and given the 
many competent architects In Canada 
this process was certainly viable. lt 
was stressed that Erickson was once a 
student of architecture, and as 
students we are taught that we must 
work together as a profession, abiding 
by the rules and conventions of the 
profession. Arthur Erlckson has been 
an Inspiration to students through his 
architecture, and Ills disappointing to 
see this political event having a 
negative effect on such feelings. it 
seemed, and was assuring , that the 
profession at the assembly was not 
condemning Erlckson as an architect, 
but was questioning the system that 
would allow such an obvious lack of 
fairness to occur. 

The Design Charette which took place 
during the conference was a good 
Idea, yet 11 did not benefit participants 
as it could have. The architects Involv­
ed took a very pragmatic approach to 
the various sites. lt seems that this 
charette (one-half day) was a chance to 
have a little Imagination and show 
some creative spark. it should be the 
Idea brought forward that Is Important , 
yet the entries all seemed to lack lm· 
aglnation · getting tied down Instead 
with details unnecessary In the 
charette process. For the students the 

situation was not that Inspiring or 
educational. For a number of reasons, 
Including the overly commercial ap­
proach taken by many of the team 
leaders, student participation was 
stifled. I do not think that any student 
had expected the job allocations that 
occurred in some of the charettes . 
What should have happened Is student 
Involvement in design decisions, with 
coordination from the team leaders. I 
must credit Norman Hoston of Van· 
couver for giving the students on his 
team the chance to be involved in the 
design process. These students were 
encouraged to explore a variation 
of the theme · which resulted in an In· 
terestlng and somewhat comical ap­
proach to the site problem. In future 
charettes I think that all the team par· 
tlclpants should work together to come 
up with designs that approach the pro­
blems In new and exciting ways. The 
charettes are a good Idea, and if pro· 
perly organized and carried out will 
benefit all those Involved. lt is the 
chance to work together and share 
ideas that makes the RAIC Assembly 
worth attending. 
A very Important topic during students' 
discussions was RAIC student 
membership. The strength of students 
of architecture In Canada is growing · 
lt seems more and more students are 
getting Involved In both their education 
and their profession. Through the stu· 
dent membership program of the RAIC 
students are benefitting '" a number of 
ways Students receive an RAIC 
membership card and cert ificate, as 
well as RAIC newsletters, student 
bulletins, THE FIFTH COLUMN Stu· 
dent Journal of Architecture, and free 
reg istration In the national competl· 
lion. More Important though, Is the 
communication potent ial that RAIC 
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membership provides. Through 
regional representation, students from 
the ten Schools of architecture can get 
Information to each other and to the 
profession. The RAIC respects the 
students' input, and places the student 
program high on Its list of priorities. 
The RAIC has given the students a 
voice on Issues through the voting 
position of Student Councillor, the na· 
tlonal president of the RAIC Student 
Program. The Input through the Stu· 
dent Councillor is extremely important, 
and on behalf of the students of ar· 
chitecture in Canada I must thank 
Stefan Wlsnlowski (McGlll Universi ty) 
for his time and efforts as Past S1udent 
Counci llor, and wish the best of luck to 
Ellse Brault (Un iversit6 de Montr6al) In 
her role as Student Councillor for the 
coming year 

I must express my satisfaction with 
the way the student program Is pro· 
gresslng. The student meetings went 
very well, with Important communica­
tion of Ideas and concerns occurring. 
The student voice at the RAIC General 
Meeting was Impressive, and I am 
pleased to have seen the interest and 
encouragement of the profession In 
student input and interaction W1th the 
cont inuing growth of participation in 
the RAIC by students of architecture 
we can benefi t not only ourselves as 
students but also the profession and 
the architecture in Canada. The lmpor· 
tance of student mvolvement In the 
RAIC cannot be underestimated. 

Brlan R. Sine/a ir IS a student at the 
Department of Enwronmental Studies 
at the Universi ty of Cafgary and 
Regtonaf Editor of THE FIFTH COL· 
UMN. 
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VILLAGE LINCOLN 

ARTHUR 
by Adam Caruso 

L ocated In dOwntown Mon­
treal, at the intersectiOn of 
Lincoln and Guy, Le Village 

Lincoln Is a modest renovation project 
convertmg a somewhat dilapidated 
residential building Into a sma I com­
mercial centre. This type of conversion 
Is widespread In Montreal and other 
cities, and has developed Its own 
predictable form. Despite this poten­
tial for the mundane, Le V1llage Is 
much ta!ked about (at least among 
those In the surround ng area). and this 
talk centres not on the opening of the 
area's lust gourmet food shop, but 
rather on the bulldmg Itself. 

y Intended 
to be noticed, but does its flam­
boyance serve any other purpose? lt is 
questionable that a small shopping 
complex need Involve Itself In a discus­
sion of universal ideal, and therefore it 
would seem safe to say that Mr. 
Beltel's neon ionic capitals and tor­
tured railings are but a celebration of 
the building's new commercial func­
tion. 

The Intention is above reproach. but 
one must question the arch•tect's 
methods of achieving this goa First 
there the lack of a central idea Instead 
of developing a congruous set of 
elements to create a sense of fun and 
commercialism, the only thing that 
relates the various ornamental devices 
would appear to be their common in­
clusion In Charles Jencks' The 
Language of Post-Modern Architec­
ture. In addition, it would seem that 
each of the building's elevations refer 
to different architects, with each side 
employing different ornamental forms, 
and even different materials (from the 
onginal brick and stone, to stucco and 
painted wood). 

As disturbing as the apparent lack of 
unlty Is the handling of materials. 
Stucco seems a particularly inap­
propriate matenal for our climate, and 
before weathering a sing e w<nter 
cracks are already appearing. Cracks 
and gaps are also evident •n the transi· 
lion between matenals Given the 
plethora of materials be1ng used, this 
makes for a very patchy outer skin. 
With the considerable cost of applying 
the stucco and bending the metal rain· 
ings (not to mention Illuminating all 
that neon months before completion of 
the project) it Is confusing why a little 
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BE I TE L 
more care was not taken In detailing a 
building so obviously concerned with 
outer appearance. 

For ail its faults, Le Village Lincoln still 
manages, somehow, to delight In Its 
frivolous forms and celebration of con· 
sumerlsm. In a city where one can find 
Dunkin' Donuts and McDonald's hous· 
ed In sensible brick structures, the 
twisted red and white neon of Le 
VIllage seems happily appropriate, and 
certainly sets the corner of Guy and 
Lincoln apart from the ordinary 

Adam Caruso Is a student at the 
School of Architecture at McGf/1 
University. 



Guy Street elevation 

Typical storefront 

General view 

Guy Street elevation at night 

elevation 

neon ionic column 
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Art and Architecture 

The Hexagonal Room, Architectural league of New York Exhibit 
1980; Cesar Pel/land W/1/lam Bailey. 
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by Wendy Eldinger. 

Architecture, as Vincent Scul/y 
describes 1t, is: " ... not an Isolated art. /t 
/s part of one large human art, which Is 
the shapmg of the physical environ­
ment and of living In it. Through the art 
of architecture human beings create 
an environment for themselves; they 
shape a space. Through the art of 
sculpture human beings populate that 
space with their own perception of the 
quality of being alive. Through the art 
of painting human beings create the If· 
fusion of every conceivable kind of en­
vironment and kind of action In relation 
to those environments". 1 

T he harmony between the 
sister arts permitted each 
to thrive separately while 

enhancing the other In Its reflection- a 
symbiosis. Sadly, the last half-century 
has witnessed a fracture In the rela· 
tionship. " Art and architecture have 
not been created jointly," critic Paul 
Goldberger has observed," .•• physical­
ly made at the same time, spiritually 
they remain far apart." 

The social, economic and political 
times contributed to this growing rift. 
Modernist theoreticians, convinced of 
the superiority of arch itecture , 
relegated the visual arts to a sup· 
plementary rather than complementary 
role. The notion of the architect as the 
prime creative force advanced by the 
Bauhaus still retains Its subscribers. 
Max Weber's comment that in the 20th· 
Century, aesthetics would replace 
ethics as the standard for moral con­
duct Is alive and before us. 

True collaboration between art and ar­
chitecture results when the contiguous 
presences of a work of art and an ar­
chitectural design are vital to the 
meaning of that spatial composition. 



Who can observe Henry Moore's recep­
tive plastic forms and Alexander 
Calder's kinetic sculpture without ad­
miring the simultaneous effects of 
counterpoint on the strict modernis 
geometry of their 'host' edifices? Yet 
Moore's reclining figures would func­
tion equally well In the pastoral land­
scape of the English countryside; and, 
If truth be known, the Calder mobiles 
which breathe an infusion of colour in· 
to their sombre architectural surroun· 
dlngs were never part of the original 
blueprint. The notion of 'art as an an· 
tldote to architecture' prevails. Ap· 
parently disinclined to the integrating 
principle, the mentality of our age con· 
tlnues to ponder architecture with art 
as the srrlere-pensee. 

The Importance of mutual resr.ect Is 
apparent In 16th-Century Rome s Pfaz. 
za del Campldogl io where 
Mlchelangelo "pushed his buildings 
back at a diagonal to show that ar­
chitecture Is supremely space and 
then placed the Roman equestrian 
statue of Marcus Aurelius 1n 1t to act 
out, through Its gesture, the creation of 
that space by human action. There 
could be no clearer demonstration of 
architecture as environment and 
sculpture as act".2 1n the Romanesque 
church designs of the 6th-Century and 
later In the Gothic cathedrals of the 
1200's the balance of art and edifice Is 
resolved. Early flgural sculpture on the 
Romanesque capitals are "primarily an 
outgrowth of the environment and con· 
form to Its architectural shape ... they 
bring the mass to life. They do not 
challenge lt".3 The Gothic cathedral 
embraced the light ot stained glass: 
" the narrative function (of the figures) 
subordinate to the overall envlronmen· 
tal colour screen".4 

Courthouse project; M/es Van der Rohe. 

Piazza del Campldogllo; Mlchelangelo. 
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The Ecole des Beaux Arts addressed 
Itself to the question of how architec­
ture, sculpture and painting should 
relate to each other. In this era a spirit 
of cooperation prevailed whereby the 
participants saw themselves enhanc· 
lng and deepening the meaning of 
each other's work. In their schemes 
prominent consideration was given to 
the Integration of painting and 
sculpture 

The phtlosoohy of total design of Frank 
Lloyd Wrlght had as Its premise the In· 
corooratlon of all arts Into a total ar· 
chltectural system. But precedence 
was always given to the enviroi"'!Tient 
which dominates; all the arts playing a 
supportive role. Le Corbus1er tried to 
synthesize painting and sculpture n 
the making of architectural form 
whereas Mles van der Rohe"s sense of 
the total environment was conceived 
with the essential presence of 
sculpture and painting. These modern 
architects, Mles, le Corbusier and 
Wrlght, concerned Wlth creating the·r 
own imagined environments, set up 
total orders which tolerated few 
associations outside their system and 
tended to eradicate all acts other than 
their own. 

The ore judice of the modern movement 
with Its aohorence of all which was not 
'of the splnt of the age' Is to be re­
examined. The Modernist doctnne 
Itself, with Its Inflexible canons and 1n· 
herent sterility, has proved itself the 
Neitzchean prisoner of Its own convic· 
lions. Recent movements, however, 
have embarked towards a broadening 
and overlapping of roles played by ar· 
lists and architects. Artists are explor· 
lng architectural dimensions ·in one of 
the popular exhibits on the gallery 
market aptly named 'Architecture by 
Artists', While architects are no longer 
shy to Impinge on the 'art scene·· m re· 
cent successful shows: 'Houses for 
Sale' and 'Art by Archhects'. Addi· 
tlonally teams of arctlltects and artists 
were com:nlsaloned by the Archltec-

Red Cube Marine Midland Building, New York; /samu Noguchi. 

tural League of New York to try their 
hands at a joint project. 

In this sympathetic climate, artists 
who design whole environments rather 
than ObJects and architects who create 
purely aesthet le experiences have 
liberated the spirits and the imagina­
tions of all who believe that creation 
and cooperation need not be mutually 
exclusive processes. 

Wendy Eldinger IS a student at tne 
School of Architecture at McGIII 
University. 
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Notes 

1. Scully, VIncent. "The Past Archltec· 
lure, Sculpture and Painting: Environ­
ment, Act and Illusion", essay In Col· 
laboratlon: Artists & Architects, Bar­
baralee Dlamonsteln, ed., Whltney 
library of Design, Watson·Guptill 
Publications, New York 1981. p17. 

2 lbid ' p18. 

3. lbid • p26. 

4. Ibid., p27 



THE 
FR I N G E 

The Fringe, by Its very definition, Is dlf· 
flcult to diagnose accurately. One can 
never quite say where the non-fringe 
stops and the fringe begins· much like 
the rings of Saturn. By The Fringe, of 
course, we mean the fringe of Archltec· 
tu re or architectural thought. Anything 
that Is not at the heart of the matter, 
anything peripheral, either In the 
underground or the suburbia of ar· 
chltecture can be considered fringe 
whether it Is sensible or silly, lmpor· 
tant or Inconsequential , coherent or 
sch lzold, revealing or redundant. 
However, despite Its remotenes, 
something can be derived and learnt 
from the Fringe. If the Fringe Is like the 
rings of Saturn, then serious or more 
central architectural thought Is like the 
planet Itself, without which the rings 
would not exist. The optional com· 
plements and enhances the necessary. 

There Is an Inner fringe and an outer fr· 
lnge. They are differentiated by their 
relative distances from the centre. Of 
course to the outer fringe the Inner fr· 
lnge Is not fringe at all, but rather part 
of the establishment, the surface, the 
core, the conforming majority. This 
puts the Inner fringe on Its defensive · 
quite understandably so. Halfway fr· 
lnge Is not poetic fringe. Alienated 
from the core and rejected by the edge, 
the Inner fringe stands alone. Since It 
Is alone Is lt perhaps the only true fr· 
lnge? In any case there Is no unity In fr· 
lngeland. 

The outer fringe, the supposed avant· 
garde, cocky, arrogant, confident and 
lunatic looks In from the edge. 
However everyone sees what the outer 
fringe does not see: there Is no outer 
edge. Frlngeland is Infinite and 
everything Is relative. There are sub· 
fringes and post-fringes .... 

One thing that Is perceived only by 
the keen-sighted Is that the fringe Is 
not really Infinite. it does not Increase 
ad Infinitum. At a certain distance it 
actually decreases until it reaches 
another surface, another centre, 
another planet. So In fact a belt of max· 
lmum frlngeness exists and because 
there are many planets this belt ex· 
tends Into a network. And where does 
lt end, this spider-web Intricately 
woven In the spheres of our minds? 

(Georges Bulette) 
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W ere gargoyles po ittcal car­
toons? Was the mocking of 
man actually a pre­

conscious antagontsm towards the 
established power structure wntch tn­
cluded pnests and archbishops and 
which curtailed the freedom of ar­
tisans? A century before the invention 
of the Guttenburg Press the average 
scribe was forced to sit at a desk and 
copy the words of the Bible. Was he 
bored to tears by his poverty? Was he 
sick of and ttred of the images of mar­

IJIW~~~rJM tyrdom of his fellow man? Did he have 
a concern for his Individuality and his 
place in the Universe? 

Gargoyles were but one form of 
political satire. In previous ages there 
were hieroglyphics, decorated Greek 
vases, Roman frescoes, and the foun­
dations of Shakespearian Theatre 
which began In the Middle and the Late 
Gothic penOds. But humour was not 
only evident In established civiliza­
tions. Many Instances of human distor­
tion were apparent In earlier vernacular lfljl)il!jfJ~~ 
cultures. What their true significance 
might have been many have pondered 
but they seem to have been hnked with 
fertility ntes rather than with po!lt car 
commentary. 



The rise of civilizations has bee 
characterized by the emergence of 
Gargoyle-like caricatures. We need on­
ly look back to our own age at the 
works of Picasso, which rest in the 
realm of such other great artists as 
Dall, Rockwell and Disney, to unders­
tand how enlightenment emerges. In 
each culture where images and 
psychic visions have been abandoned 
In favour of materialism and func­
tionalism, there has emerged an an­
tithetical tendency towards the foun­
dations of new spiritual and artistic 
heights. 

In looking to the early Dorlc origins o 
the later Hellenistic Greek art we 
recognize that the simple untreated 
surfaces which related to the anti­
Imagery Hebraic tradition were soon 
replaced by more highly decorated sur­
faces with sculptural and textural 
treatment. Simple heraldic cartoons 
are evident In astrological symbols and 
representations of the Gods. Less 
known however Is the similar 
emergence of Gargoyles from the early 
Christian era, and from the Byzantine 
civilization In which the Arabs pracllc­
ed their neat geometrical repetitions In 
angles and swirls which resemble cur-

rent work by architect Moshe Safdle 
and by artist Judy Chicago, whose 
"Dinner Party" has recently been 
displayed in galleries across North 
America. 

Following what has now been iden­
tified as the Gargoyle Stage of 
development we find that a period of 
cultural turmoil occurs. The confltct of 
state control with the devlopment of In­
dividual autonomy can be identified in 
every major civilization. 

In the Renaissance the problems of 
this transition reach an historical 
height. Many architectural artists 
branch Into varied domains producing 
Post-Gargoyle Imagery Including 
Madonnas, Geniuses and Scenes of 
War As the wars of the reformation 
mount, the art becomes Increasingly 
serious and Intellectual. The fly in 
Flg.1, the letting down of the fly In 
F/g.2 and the child who stands curious­
ly before the warriors in Andrea 
Mantegna's "St James before Herod 
Agrippa" point to the graveness of 
Renaissance humour. 

n the third stage of Gargoyle develop­
nt, Reblrthlng, we see the humour of 

a child's head emerging from the 
balustrade painted on the ceiling of the 
Camera degli Sposl in the Palazzo 
Ducale in Mantua. Notice the wonder­
ful perspective distortions and the evi­
dent scale of the grown-up head of the 
Arab versus that of the cupids. Humour 
now moves from the grotesquenes of 
combat to the more subtle interplays 
of sensuality. Comic art In architecture 
had come a long way from its earlier 
Gargoyle stages. Notice how Jupiter 
takes the cupid In Raphael's "Juptter 
and Cupid" and holds him to the cheek 
in a keen fatherly embrace. In 
Raphaet 's next mural, "The Venus and 
the Psyche" notice the inhibition in the 
offering of the young lady, a commen· 
tary which would still find many mean­
Ingful symbolic moments In the con­
text of our modern age. In his 
"Gala tea" Raphaet presents the darker 
side of Romance and perhaps In so do· 
lng invents the toy gun and pistol In his 
trinity of bow-and-arrow lending 
cupids. 

The Reformation is an uneasy time, 
and the Gargoyle and tts eQuivalent In 
the prayer bOok drawings do much to 
transform the existing papal-state rela­
tionship. When Matcolm reacted to the 



drawings in Queen Mary's Btbte, ne 
contrived to twtst her possess1on of 
the oooks to his own purpose in revil­
Ing her religion. Mary, In a way io\hich 
very much resembles the actMties of 
the antl-porn wings of the Womens' lib 
moveme:'lt, spread ruin and desolation 
through her kmgdom. 

The dialectical confrontation between 
God and the Devil v.hlch represented 
the contest between those who ruled 
by process and those who achieved by 
artisan abilities was elsewhere sym· 
bohzed In tne edif1ces and endeavours 
of the State. The Lion and tne Unicorn 
were the classic heraldtc symbols used 
to demonstrate th1s contest. The sym­
bol was s1rlngently applied but Its 
history was not always taken w.th tne 
same seriousness as during the Refor· 
mation when the Uon o• SI Mark 
became the symbol or the new 
capllaltstlc power In Venice For exam­
ore, a humorously drawn •on s seen 
olaylng draut~hts with an antelope on a 
papyrus (at the Bntash museum) datmg 
from tne lime of Ramses Ill and Nhlch 
Is the prototype of the modern cartoon 
strip. Next to the Uon a Hyena plays 
the flute, while a cat wavers a crool<ed 
stick. In another papyrus at Tunn, used 

as the last olate In Lepsuls' "Auswaht," 
the lion-headed Pharoah Is seen with a 
lady in the form of a gazelle. Often the 
Lion represents the force of Christian I· 
ty overcommg the Devil In Gothic art. 
but as In "Le Beau Dteu" at Amiens, 
sometimes the figure of Chnst is seen 
emerging victorious with the Uon 
under one foot and the Dragon under 
the other. The meaning of the symbol 
therefore depends very much upon the 
particular context and the beliefs of 
the artist. 

With the emergence of the reformed 
churches In the 17th-Century the range 
of characters multtplles until the ceil· 
lngs teem with the symbOls of various 
cultures, increasing the scope Infinite· 
ly beyond the dialectic, the tnnity. and 
the saints • signalling the movement 
towards the current political cartoon. 

In the pre-Reformation the force of God 
versus the Devil dominated the conflict 
between two thinkers or Individuals 
Such a conflict mounted w th the 
emergence of Mlchelangelo and 
Leonardo da Vlnci. Uke white versus 
black, M1chelangelo was concerned 
with essences and spintual light while 
Leonardo concentrated on geometry 

and invention as expressed 10 his 
technoiOQical sketches and drawings. 
As the Renaissance was to continue, 
the force of technology was to be pit· 
ted against the Individual creator. and 
with the fall of the Kings and the 
emergence of Democracy and 
systemization, classical art was also 
to fall and the modem period com· 
mence. 

The conflict between M lchelangelo 
and the Pope has often been cited in 
Protestant Interpretations of the 
events leading to the creation of the 
Sistine Chapel ceiling. Having studied 
n The Schools of the Medicls, was 
Mlchelangelo possibly a Reformer? 
Although he expressed an ardent 
degree of humour and satire as is 
evidenced by the raft people In his 
work "The Flood", it Is difficult to 
believe that with the immense dedica· 
lion of effort towards the representa· 
tlon of biblical scenes Mlchelangelo 
himself was moving towards atheism 
or selfhood. Although he was a 
religious housekeeper much like 
today's Knshna, and was Interested in 
the human body and eating well (he 
had to be In order to create the master· 
pieces that he did), he had not seemed 



to have removed himself from the · 
essences of God's Universe. Did 
Michelangelo ever mock the Church? 
Perhaps not, but there Is In the Medlcl 
Chapel built for Lorenzo a frieze on the 
entablature with a very strange relief 
just below the triglyphs. In this relief Is 
the repeated image of a two·toothed 
visage with an tonically shaped 
mustache, Is perhaps an Image of 
Lorenzo, or perhaps a self-portrait of 
Mlchelangelo himself. The figure 
reminds one very much of Salvador 
Dali (who was perhaps himself a 
gargoyle}, quite eccentric looking with 
his straight whiskers. it Is said that 
Mlchelangelo's gargoyle was produced 
1n response to an incident which oc· 
cured early In his life, In which Lorenzo 
Medlcl looked at the sculpture and 
said "it doesn't look old ... old people 
lose some of their teeth" Following 
this, it Is said, Michelangelo hollowed 
out the teeth so that they appeared ex· 
actly the way the Medicl had desired. 
After this, Lorenzo took the young ar· 
list Into his Institute. Four centuries 
later young men get taken in by old 
men who no longer lack their teeth 
because they have had the spaces fill· 
ed In with gold. The relationships bet 
ween teacher and philanthropist, 

technologist and artisan are Indeed In· 
terestlng ones and make for the 
diverse human relationships we see 
about us today 

In the eye of the storm, some men 
never lost the intensity of the vortex of 
the tornado However, the discipline 
that characterized Individual creators 
such as Borromini In architecture or 
Raphael In art was broken by the ad· 
vent of the age of Liberation or 
Abstractlonlsm. 

For bil lions of years the artist had 
struggled towards a sense of his con· 
sclous self and discipline. In the age of 
Liberation he begins to be released 
from the huge vortex which had kept 
him In Its grasp. From the time of 
Giulio Romano, who had painted ''Two 
Lovers" (presently in the Hermitage, 
Len lngrad) we find the increasing flight 
towards sexual freedoms. In the Jlml 
Hendrlx period of the 1960's this 
ultimate liberation of black and white 
appears. The paintings of Tintoretto 
over two centuries earlier and prior to 
the fall of the Kings express a similar 
magnificence of light and shadow. The 
females are encased In an artificial 
naturalness, In a denturely white. In 

"Leda and the Swan" we see the at· 
traction of the young female for her 
white swan friend In Dionlsio Cslvert's 
scene "Danae" we find a very 
humourous Image of a young woman 
and cupid who are catching money 
which falls from the heavens. In 
Titian's "Festival of Venus" the con· 
centration of the luminousity on the 
cupids Is evident. The gargoyle has 
been reduced from the enraged and 
crazy looking creature of the early 
Gothic to the loving tenderness of the 
cupidlc child. 

In the SUrrogate Gargoyle era which 
follows after the dtvorce from 
classicism, Men beg'n to ook 
elsewhere to find lhetr symbols. No 
longer usmg such 1magery as beasts, 
lions, swans or cupids, they try to use 
such new symbols as erasers and soup 
cans. They try to detach the painting 
and the sculpture from their poSition In 
architecture. Man, however, has never 
seen himself in a greater way as the 
totality of the enVIronment, mistaking 
his liberation to be merely a sp~rltual 
definition. The Pharoahs must have 
had a different desire, as have men 
throughout history to strive for Immor­
tality through structure and geometry. 



11 lsiilth~r~ou~giih!tt~h~e~u~n~d~er~s!!!ta~nd!iling~o~f~ ~~~~~~~;~~=;~~~i~~~s~plrltually travel using the feelings or 

chromosomes and recomblnant DNA geometrical capacities of the mind . 
that we &ee a new rationalism emerg· The second phase Is characterized by 
lng out of this century's earlier relating, and Is analogous to the pro· 
vftallsm. blem of stepping out of an individual 

The structure of DNA, and the four 
basic am no acids which program life 
g e us tho philosophical basis for the 
4 R's of Art: response, rhytllm or 
representation, recall, and relativity. 
Historically we have moved from a 
period of Man's r•ponae to nature in· 
to the period of an mated falm and 
rhythm, wh eh was the basis of the 
Modern Movement. TOday we stand on 
the cultural brink In Western clvfllza· 
Ion of two new periOds. The first Is 

rec111, through the conservation of 
historical memones, and the ability to 

cell's nucleus which gave you birth in· 
to the vacuole of the universal cell. You 
are In danger of being caught by other 
structures and destroyed. This will 
become the 21st·Century conflict of In· 
divlduals versus gods and systems. 
For some this conflict already occurs 
In contemporary society. 

Brlan Lorne Msged received B 
Bachelor of Science (Architecture) 
from the School ol Architecture at 
McG/11 University m 1977. 



D
epuls toujours l'ambltlon 
endlablee du pouvolr chez 
l'homme est cause de guer-

res. Les consequences en sont tou· 
]ours les mAmes; un massacre horrible 
d'Atres humalns au benlflce de ... per· 
sonne. Mats helas, la guerre se fait 
lronlquement toujours porteuse de 
palx. En vain! 

Les heros dans cette confusion sont 
les soldats. Ces pauvres Idiots, de 
stmples pions dans cet affreux jeu de 
meurtrler, sont uses comme des 
chlens sales. Amenes en masses aux 
chantlers de destructlons, Its en revlen· 
nent blesses s'lls sont chanceux mats 
plusleurs y restent A jamals. Les sur· 
vlvants, marques A vie, retournent a 
leur patrie et se perdent dans l'oublle. 
Les morts eux se font 'glorifier' et com­
memorer avec des monuments et des 
necropoles; !'art 'patriotlco-tlmulalre' 
qu'on appelle.1 

L'lmaglnatlon artistlque chez l'homme 
est seduit par les atrocltes de la guerre 
et l'art patrlotlco-tlmulalre n'est pas 
d'exceptlon. L'eclectlsme dans eel art 
est stupeflant autant pour la variete In· 
tense des ses nombreux sujets que 
pour la dlverslte de ses styles. D'une 
part, le romantlsme joue avec les con· 
dltlons extremes de terreur qullul sont 
offerte tandls que le classicisme lul, 
consldere le soldat comma I'Atre hu· 
main Ideal et en fin 11 y a le symbolisme 
qui lul est intimement lie au cadre cpn· 
ceptuel qui rend une guerre possible. 
" ... The existence of war can be seen to 
be dependent on the effectiveness of 
symbolism ... " 2 

Malheureusement, comme dans tout 
art, seul un petit pourcentage con· 
stltue de verltables chef d'oeuvres. 
Ceux-cl fuslonnent !'architecture et la 
sculpture pour creer un peu d'inspira· 
tlon A la memolre des vtctlmes de la 
guerre. "Temple de la mort... Votre 
aspect dolt gtacer nos coeurs ... le but 
qu'on se propose l'orsqu 'on IJ/eve ces 
sortes de monuments est de perpetuer 
la memo/re de ceU>( auquels 1/s sont 
consecres. 11 taut done que ces 
monuments solent conr;us de man/ere 
A braver le ravage des temps".3 

Sir Edwln Lutyens, principal archltecte 
de la "Imperial War Graves Commis· 
slon" en 1917, en fut l'auteur de 
plusleurs. Ses monuments insplrent 
une palx et une serenlte dans leur com­
position et leur masse. Son memorial 
australlen de Vlllers Bretonneux en 
partlculler est un magnlflque arrange· 
ment d'elements archltectonlques 
classlques gracleusements entrelaclls 
en un tout exceptional. D'un geste 
lronlque, Luytens complete ses ex· 
plolts archltecturaux en flgeant quatre 
drapeaux de plerre comma d'lm 
moboles sentlnelles velllant sur les 
morts. C'est un chef d'oeuvre d'une 
orlglnalltll grandiose mala qui dans le 

Pour la 
Gloire 
de la 

Guerre 
par Charles Henri Brunet 

Charles-Henri Brunet est un etudiant a 
I'IJcole d'architecture de McGIII Univer­
sity. 

fond n'est qu 'un temple pour rendre 
hommage non pas aux soldats mals a 
la guerre. Le memorial canadlen a 
Vlmy en France deW. Alluard nous of· 
fre lul aussl un spectacle tHourdissant. 
Ses deux 'eperons stalagmltes'4 s'ele­
vent A plus de 140 pieds au desSlJs 
d'un socle de pierre, s·amincissant 
graduellement jusqu'a ce qu'lls se 
transforment en sculptures represen­
tant la paix, la justice. la vllrite et la 
connalssance. D'autre figures en deull 
se haussent de tout leur chagrin A la 
base de ses ar&tes de plerres. '/Is sym· 
bollsent sobrement ce qui fut le 
calva/re des assail/ants de cette 
cr~te '5 Un symbollsme de souffrances 
causlls par une guerre qui se retrouve 
encore une fois glorlflee. Une guerre de 
palx .. et de justice ... ! Real del Sarte, 
d'une slncerlte qui lui est pertlcullere 
fut l'auteur de quelques sculptures 
tres emouvantes. Sculpteur, il perdlt la 
main dans une lutte de corps a corps 
aux tranchlles. Mals 11 reussl a triom· 
pher de son lourd handicap. 11 s'agit 
d'apprllcler son monument de la forme 
Navarln ou encore celui des Eparges 
oour nous en convaincre Dans ceder· 
nler on crolrait voir cette main de pierre 
se dechlrer de son soc1e a fin de gravir 
le sobre monument. 

Plusieurs autres monuments de plus 
petltes echelles pourralent aussl Atre 
classlfllls comma chef d'oeuvres pour 
leur conception artlstlque. Les plus 
frappant jouent avec le romantlsme et 
sont tres souvent dramatlques. Le 
monument aux morts de Sillery-en · 
Champagne reprllsente une femme de 
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plerre agenoulllee sur l'herbe auprb 
de la tombe de son blen a lme et corn­
me si le temps n'y etalt pour rien, elle 
pleura son marl A jamals. Aux alen· 
tours de Vermelles on retrouve un 
soldat terrlfle le regard fixe sur une 
grenade qui A son horreur est A la 
vellles de lul enlever la vie. Et un autre 
monument, celul de Varlecle a Polncy 
est une expression symbollque et ex­
tremement dramatlque du saorlflce de 
la France lors de la guerre 14-18. Mats 
malgre leur valeur artlstlque, tous ces 
monuments aux morts de la guerre ne 
sont qu'une excuse non pas pour 
honorer le soldat mais pour glorifier la 
guerre. N'oublions pas que le principal 
promoteur de cet art est l'etat et c·est 
aussle l'etat qui se sert de ces jeunes 
hommes pour les envoyer a la guerre 
malgr~ eux afin qu'lls puissant sauver 
leur patrie pour qu'enfin rl!gne la paix 
dans le monde! Ouel hypocrisie' En 
une decennia (de 1920 a 1930) !rente 
sept mllles monuments de guerre 
furent eriges en France C'est de la 
folie, un art Industrialise qui resulte 
d'un ravage d'~tres humains lut aussi 
suite de l'lndustriallsatlon chez 
l'homme. 11 suffit de leur eriger quel· 
ques monuments ou encore de leur 
ded ler une autoroute ou un pont et lis 
sont oublles. Le soldat lnconou qui a 
lalssll parents, femme et enfants de­
viant un nom parmis tant d'autre ln­
scrlt sur un plaque commemorative 
quelque part en Europe ou en Amen· 
que. Et nous. survivants. devont falre 
deull face a leur horrible sort. 

"A /a memolre de ceux qui sont tombiJs 
comme exhortation aux vivants. et, 
pour ceux qui viendront, un exemp e 
dont·ils doivent s'inspirer .. .'(; 

Dans ce massacre humaln, nul en sort 
valnqueur. Le spiritual n'etant pas suf· 
flsant l'homme cherche a materialiser 
son aveu aux soldats. Mais malgre les 
prouesses archltecturales et symboll· 
ques que l'on retrouve chez quelques 
uns de ces memorials, le soldat est 
oublie et la guerre s'accapare de tous 
les trophlles. Elle demeure invalncue 

Notes 

Cet article fait suite au livre de J.M. de 
Busscher, Les Folies de l 'lndustrfe qui 
a ete presentll a THE FIFTH COLUMN 
de la part de la matson d'editioo Ar· 
ch1ves d'Architecture Moderne. 
1. J.M. de Busscher, Les Folies de l'ln· 

dustrie, Archives d 'Architecture 
Moderne, 1981. 

2. Ken Baynes, War Art & Society 
One. 
Boston Book & Art Publisher, 1970 
p . 57. 

3. E.L. Boullee, Architeure. essal sur 
l 'art, boullle helen rosenau, 
AcadM11e Editions, 1976, p. 135. 

4. J.M. De Busscher, ibld, p. 120. 
5. J.M. De Busscher, lbld, p. 120. 
6. J.M. De Busscher, Ibid. p. 16. 
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F I V E 
IN 

by Jlll Bambury and l..arry Rlchards 

0 ne of the clear successes of 
the Royal Archltectura' In· 
stttute of canada·s 1982 

Assembly held in Winnipeg, Man1toba 
was the May 31st program of Charette 
Workshops. Followtng the theme of 
the RAIC Assembly, " Bom Aga n 
Build ings", five teams made up of ar· 
chllects, architectural students. and 
local developers focused on the for­
mula tion of Ideas for preserving and re· 
juvenatlng the fabric of Winnipeg 's 
historic " warehouse district' • an area 
just north of the Intersection of Por­
tage and Main Streets whi ch contains 
a surpraslng number of architectura 
gems from the late eighteenth and ear­
ly nlnteenth centunes (warehouses as 
well as const itut ional and commercial 
Dulldmgs). 

Altnougn riddled wtth windswept ots 
edged by a neglected river bat''<. and 
anchored by what must be Canada s 
worst example of "mole clty",1 the 
district clearly has the potent1al to be 
tra nsformed Into a vtta t, urban 
neighbourhood. But it became obv•ous 
to the cnarette teams working under 
the leadership of Vancouver's Randte 
lreda le and Montreal's Peter Rose that 
the d lstnct lacks the key Ingredients 
needed to create a convincing urban 
quarter; about 5000 people. And that 
means ho~alng for 5000 people. 

TYPE OF HOUSING 
Low-rise, enfrontfng park 
and forming edge along Red River 

Tower, lormmg gate-way to park 
along RecJ River 

lnfl/1, remforcing eJtistlng system 
of streets. 

Rehabflltat1on and conversfon 
existing buildings 

Houseboata, along edge of Red River. 

HOUSES 
Wl N N 

Accepting this need for housing, we 
became convmced that although the 
RAIC Charette Workshop participants 
could {and did) chum out provocative 
magic-marker-on-yellow-trace draw­
Ings of urban schemes for a happy 
future, something more could be done 
In the six-hour charette period set 
aside by the organizers to prove that 
' 'The dynamics of the urban context as 
expressed In the scope of the 
Assembly's Theme Is best realized in 
some form of active partlclpatlon." 2 

So as real May 31st action for 
ourselves and as a symbol of the need 
for people of Winnipeg to act - to par­
tic ipate i n the rebirth of their 
marvelous downtown bui ldings - we 
buil t In a period of two hours, 'ive 
''houses" In the historic d istrict. Each 
of the five (constructed from materials 
found on the Indi vidual sites) 
represented a type of housing which 
we believed to be appropriate for the 
d1strlct (see box Inset). 

Beyond the Immediate needs and 
possibilities of providing housing In 
downtown Winnipeg, these five con­
structions represent two more general 
concerns. 1) the Importance of doing 
more with less during a period of 
general scarcity and hard times, and 2) 
the Importance of being committed to 
architectural ideals, to architectural 

LOCATION 
Afong path In grassy field 
overlookmg Red R1ver 

At the foot of McDermott Avenue. 

In parkette on McDermott Avenue, 
east of Main Street. 

In vestibule of No. 141 
Bannatyne A venue. 

In Red River at foot of 
McDermott Avenue 

p E G 

participation, and to action. 

The FIVE HOUSES IN WINNIPEG were 
built quickly from fragments from the 
place. They have no doubt already 
returned to various fragmentary states. 
But for us, for others who participated 
in and reviewed the Charette 
Workshops and, maybe, for those 
citizens of Winnipeg who came across 
the little houses on their daily journles, 
memories remain of the mysterious, 
symbolic housing which seems so 
necessary for the birth of what could 
be one of Canada's new and great 
neighbourhoods. 

Notes 

1. The underground shopping con­
course at the Intersection of Portage 
and Main Is boring and unnecessary; 
but the real horror show Is at 
grade/street level where fixed concrete 
barricades prevent pedestrians from 
crossing the streets· le. everyone Is 
forced underground. 

2. 1982 RAIC Assembly Registration 
Information, page 3. 
J/11 Bambury received a Bachelor of Ar· 
chltecture degree from the Technical 
University of Nova Scotlaln 1982. Larry 
Rlchards was appointed Director of the 
School of Architecture at the Unlversf· 
ty of Waterloo In 1982. 

MATERIALS 
Three wooden crates: 
red cotton drapes. 

Exfstlng wooden post; long twigs; 
leather Jacket; plastic frisbee, red cot· 
ton flags. 

Four steel pipes; two air filters; 
steef transformer box; red cotton 
square. 

Two bricks; one triangular piece 
of concrete; red bunting. 

Styrofoam fragments; twigs; steel rod; 
clear plastic, red cotton awnfng. :; 

~--------------------------------------------------------------------~ ! 24 THE Fl FTH COLUMN, Summer 1982 



THE FIFTH COLUMN, Summer 1982 

and the fifth one floated away ... 
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W.A.T. 

Oddswith 

(1881·1965) 

by David Farley 

I 
t seems likely that historical 
research will continue to 
reveal forgotten and 
overlooked architects who 

made significant conlrlbut.,ons to the 
evolution of modern destgn. Such a 
designer was Wagstaff Oddsw1th. He 
is amonst those arcn1tects wnose in­
fluence on the modern movement 
demands re-evaluation and,lt I may be 
so bold, recognltlonJI This year 1s the 
ftltleth anniversary of Henry-Russet 
Hilchcoclo; and Phlllp Johnson's land­
mark 'Modern Architecture· show at 
tne Museum ol Modern Art (1932). That 
important show dtd not include the 
work of W. Oddswith and on that 
remarkable oversight I shall have more 
to say later. For it seems Inevitable to 
me that Oddswith's build ings w th 
the~r combmatlon of the vernacular, 
anthropomorphism, class,cal motifs 
and Informed attention to funct1on and 
expression will be seen In retrospect 
as pace-setting. 

Oddsw1th was bOrn In 1881 in Kirkin· 
tlllocn near Glasgow. His parents, 
Orkn'-'Y and Iona Oddswlth had sett ed 
In Glasgow after a bad experience n 
Glentarfl on the shores of Loch Ness tn 
1863. Orkney was the world famous 
breeder of scotch terriers and Iona was 
a large animal trainer and pioneer 
neurochemlst.12l Both parents would 
seem to have had a powerful, and to 
my mind positive influence on their 
son's career and work.. Wagstaff was 
around dogs from an early age. which 
perhaps explains the profound in­
fluence of the canme on his ideas. 11 
was natural tor him to help his parents 
around the kennels. By the age of 8 he 
was designing and constructing dog 
houses. He had also developed a lively 
interest In terner brains and their 
chemistry. The reader may be In­
terested in a science class essay he 
wrote at the age of ten et tied 
Elcosanolds: Prostagladtns Throm­
boxanes, Leukotrlenes, and Other 
Oerlvatlve3 of Carb0n·20 Unsaturated 
Fatty Acids'. Wagstaff, In character, 
comes dtrectly to lhe point: 

The Isolation of the prostaglandin 
endoperoxldes13J PGG and PGH 

(Httmberg and SBmuelson, 1873; 
Hamberg et el.. 1874b}, was the 
cruciel study that led to the 
discovery of thrombaxane A2 
(TxA2), a very unstable but highly 
potent sggregator of platelets and 
a/so a vsscoconstrlctor, and its 
hydrolysis product, thromboxane 
82, formerly known and PHD 
(Httmberg et si., 18751. The activity 
of TxA2 hsd prelously been describ· 
ed ss rabbit sorts constracting 
substance (Piper and Vane, 1869). 
The enzyme fstty scld cyclox­
ygensse, which cerlyzes without 
difficulty demonstrates natures 
simplicity. 

Overnight, W.O. was established as a 
young scientist of unusual promise 
and shortly thereafter he found himself 
oblfged to make a cho•ce between a 
lectureship in cyclooxygenesis at Ox­
ford or a career in architecture. 

Fortunately for cyclooxygenesis, he 
chose the latter and was sent to study 
under F.H. Newbery at the Glasgow 
School of Art. Not surprisingly, he did 
well Some'•1 said that Charles Rennie 
Macintosh (1868-1928) was lntluenceo 
by his designs. There seems little 
doubt that Oddswith's first year pro· 
ject for a cafeteria for canlnes<Sl in 
downtown Glasgow (1895) was an im­
portant source of ideas for 
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Macintosh's second Cranston Tea­
room, Sauchlehall Street, Glasgow. 

In his final year. Wagstaff or Wag as he 
became known to his friends ran Into 
Adolt Loos (1870-1933),16! who said 
"For Christ's sake can't you watch 
where you're going?" Wagstaff, you 
see, lived ten miles from school and 
had become a pioneer of modem jogg· 
lng.m 1t is not generally known that Od-

.dswith bulldlings look best when seen 
tearing past them In Adldas. 

' 

Waiter Groplus (1883-1969), a friend of 
Loos', was a visiting student in 
Glasgow that same year, 1898. He is 
reputed to have told his instructor 
"Don't accept too many wags", to 
which Macintosh replied "Oh go 
design a Fag us factory." Gropius, 
upset by this rebuff, left the school, 
went to visit Macintosh's wife 
Margaret Macdonald and her sister 
Mrs. McNair at their homes. He then 
flew directly back to Germany by train. 
Meanwhile, Wagstaft, who was seven­
teen, was completing his final 
project ,<8l a mausoluem for the 
pedigreed dogs of an aristocratic faml· 
ly. This is the project which subse­
quently caused such a great debate at 
the 1900 World's Fair In Paris where lt 
was exhibited In the animal husbandry 
pavilllon. This project was to result in 
an Important first commission for him: 
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the little-known mausoleum for the 
aristocratic dogs of a pedigreed fami· 
ly. Regrettably, since the client in­
sisted on anonlmlty, the building has 
never been photographed and Its loca­
tion Is unknown. Nevertheless, my ac­
cess to the personal sketch booksl9l of 
Oddswith gives us some Idea of the 
project as carried out. 

Notice the heavily wooded landscape 
with what appears to be a quadrapedlc 
building at the edge of the water with 
dog faced capitals and little moribund 
doggles all In a row as ornament. 

Oddswlth can, at this time, be placed 

\~09 

at the centre of the arts and crafts 
debate and squarely In the romantic 
English house tradition (or just outside 
lt) with more than a touch of 19th· 
Century classical mannerism. With the 
placement of the paw-shaped capitals 
In odd positions he clearly established 
himself as a mannerist's mannerlst. 
Gombrlch(tOl suggests that his use of 
dog ears and paws Inspired Esher to In· 
vent counterchange. 

it will be no surprise then, to the 
reader,that Wagstaff had become a 
mortal enemy of Loos who around this 
time (6 p.m., Nov. 13, 1899) was writing 
his first essays for newspapers and 
periodicals. Loos was attacking Art 
Nouveau In all Its forms, Including the 
efforts of the VIennese Zezesslon and 
the Glasgow School and he singled out 
Oddswlth for particular disdain. When 
Wagstaff and Macintosh and the 
Glasgow group arrived In VIenna on 
the Invitation of the Zezesslon to their 
annual exhibition In late 1900, Loos 
was there to picket at the railway sta­
tion with a placard which said: 

DIE HUND GEBAUDE STINKEN 
Wag was furious. He bounded forward 
snapping at Loos' tails and swung him 
to the ground, growling, "You are a 
bloody louse". He would not let Loos 
get up_,,,, 

The police arrived and the antagonists 
were separated but they never forgave 

each other. lt was eight years later 
(1908) and largely due to this Incident 
that Loos assembled his writing into 
the now famous volume 'Ornament 
und Verbrecken•tl2\ 

Of course the reader knows the in· 
fluence exerted by this show of the 
Glasgow group on the Ideas of the 
Zezesslonlsts, on 'Ver Sacrum', on 
Kllmt, Kokoschka and Schlele, on 
Mahler, Freud and Schnltzler, on 
Wagner, Olbrlch, Hoffman, Groplus, 
Meyer, Poelzlg, Miss Van Der Rohe, 
Berg, Behrens, on Dasher, Dancer unCI 
Prancer, on VIxen, Donner und Blltzen, 
on Austria and on the career of Macln-

tosh, who was commissioned to fur­
nish and decorate the Music Room for 
Futz Warndorfer in 1901 and how 
Warndorfer gave, two years later, the 
money for the foundation of the Welner 
Werkstatte. 

Overlooked in the heat of these events 
was the Important commission which 
Oddswith carried out for the Viennese 
S.P.C.A. The president of the society, 
Woffgang Muttzart, had been to the 
Paris exhibition and had seen 
Wag staff's work. He sought Wag out in 
VIenna and asked him to design an 
animal mausoleum on the outskirts of 
Vienna. This of course resulted In the 
well-known 'Der Bauhundhaus' (1909). 

Oddswlth's reputation was made, he 
was modestly well-off and he decided 
to travel. At 29 he set out on a world 
tour with his seven scotch terriers 
(named after the seven lamps of ar­
chitecture) returning to England In 
1918 at the age of 39with a sketchbook 
full of Ideas and 17 dogs. On his Journey 
he had designed ten buildings. One 
each year, each one more dog-ear'd 
than the last.<13l His design for the 
dogate Is particularly noteworthy with 
Its biscuit wall paper (1911), as Is his 
Chinese Doglegged Park In Evanston, 
Illinois (1912) and his prestressed con­
crete Dog Compound In Dade County, 
Florida (1914). 
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These projects illustrated the dogged 
discipline of young Wag's work. They 
are unremittingly functional.. They 
demonstrate a concern for proportion 
and scale equal to the masters and 
they are expressive. Marsden Filch 
called his work uncanny and aromatic. 
Mumford called it pungent, and the 
A.I.A. cited Oddswlth for 'unlmpoochl· 
ble clarity of purpose' 

During this period Wagstaff cor· 
respondedt14l with Wafter Groplus, ex­
pounding on the importance of the 
senses In perception and the require­
ment for a Gestalt approach to design. 
Wag was also encouraging Waiter to 

set up a new school using these Ideas 
so it was no surprise that Wagstaff 
should be Invited to teach at the new 
Staatllches Bauhaus upon its open•ng 
In 1919. Thus began the mature stage 
of Oddswith's oeuvre. 

For ten years Wag des•gned so many 
dog gone things that a complete review 
of them must be left for later 15 

However the highlights are listed 
below. 

1920 The Purlna Dog Chow Factory. 
Lanslng 

1921 Dog Chow 
1922 Dog Leash I 
1923 Dog Leash 11 (acryl ic) 
1924 The Dr. Ballard Building, Buf­

falo 
1925 The Barbara Woofhouse 

Residence, London 
1926 A Bentwood Muzzle 
1927 A Fire Hydrant 
1928 Addition to Oer Bauhundhaus, 

Vienna 
1929 'The Muttular' 
1930 Small Shovel in Sterhng'1 

1931 Dog House for the Royal 
Dollhouse, Windsor Castle. 

In 1932, the MoMA held its celebrated 
exhibition on the 'style lnternatiooale'. 
As I mentioned earlier. Phlllp Johnson 
and Henry-Russell Hltchcock, the 
organizers of the show, deliberately 
omitted Oddswlth's work! 
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Many people have asked me how this 
pernicious omission from the 1932 
MoMA show could have occured. The 
&Jtplanation IS that W~ had alienated 
the aforementioned pair (Justly 
notorious} at a party held at a Bauhaus 
exhibition in 1928. The Prince of Wales 
and I arrived late but In time for 
Wagstaff's recitation of a poem wh1ch 
In retrospect seems highly avant-garde 
tor !ts time and was considered an af· 
front.C17l His effort was extem­
poraneous and the only precise record 
comes from a letter written by Mrs. A 
Vanoerbullt to Henry R Hope about 
the state of manners 10 a civilized 
society. According to Amy. and the 
Prince and I can confirm 1t, Wagstaff 
stood up after the soup course (which 
accordmg to her he ate w•ttlout usmg 
his hands 18J and recited thts -

Fuss Cuss Fuss over form 
With funct1on finding the norm 
When technology exhorted 
The Baunaus aborted 
And dogma emerged unreformed 

The party degenerated with hostile 
words being exchanged between Odd· 
swltll and the two historians. Wag said 
they were " barking up the wrong tree 
together" and Phllip accused Wag of 
turn ing the dinner party Into a 'do~fs 
breakfast'.ll~ That was In 1928. it was 
not until the MoMA show opened In 
1982 that the pioneers of the modern 
movement realized how deeply Odd· 
swlth's limerick had been resented. 
Wagstaff was stunned. He was. as he 
said to me "at odds with h1msell. 

The seriousness of this oversight d'd 
not bear fru1t until 1939. In that year 
a'ter attendmg the N.Y. Worlds Fa 1r 
Wag bolted to Berlin and In a lit of p • 
Que, offered his services to the Th rd 
Relch. 1t Is ludicrous to me that the In· 
fluence of Wagstaff on Albert Speer 
has been overlooked. Many of Speer's 
mongrel motives can be traced directly 
to Wag's early work. For example, the 
way Speer's bulldtngs squat. The Duke 
and Duchess of Windsor noticed this 
and asked me to introduce them to Od· 
dswlth. This I did on my yacht at 
Monaco In the spring of 194:l. I 
remember the occasion well because 
we had such fun playing 'kick the can' 
on all fours. 

But what about the buildings 
themselves: How d1d Oddswith regard 
his own work? We do know that he 
spent a lifetime trying to understand 
Le Corbus1er's 'Le Modular' and that 
he was convinced that mathematical 
ideas about proportion and order were 
the source of meaning In architecture, 
even If he couldn't figure out why. Not 
that he was a neo-classicist by any 
means. However, I have been able to 
discover a d1rect geometric relation· 
ship between Oddswlth's Punna Dog 
Chow Factory and the Treasury of the 
Slpnnlans, Sanctuary of Apollo, Delphi 

c. 530 B.C. They are exactly 1883 miles 
apart which Is the year the Scottish 
Terrier Club of England was founded! 

On the expressive side, Oddswlth had 
few equals in his time. His buildings 
were not ducks In the Venturl sense 
but rather dogs. Ministerial terriers for 
governent buildings, playful pups In 
his residential work and mongrels for 
his famous factories and a school. The 
fact that there are far more species of 
dogs than there are ducks resulted In a 
richness of sources for Oddswlth's 
work which he exploited fully.C201 

As a functlonllst, Wagstaff's buildings 
were very tightly organized. The se· 
quence of spaces from snout to tall 
were always arranged from a tunc· 
tlonallst viewpoint. The fact that every 
building has a recognizable front, side 
and rump Is not, of course, high 'Inter· 
national style· We could say. I should 
think, that he jumped over the interna· 
tlonal style into the postmodern move· 
ment. Nevertheless, the function of the 
building and 1ts structure were made 
deliberately visible. We have that syn· 
thes•s of form and function so highly 
regarded by late modernists and so 
well-defended by Huxtable, who called 
Wag·s der Bauhundhaus a minor 
masterpiece. 

The reader may have noticed how 
much of Wag's practice was related to 
dogs. There are a number of critics 
who claim that this dogglshness Is a 
weakness 1n Oddswlth 's work! 1 could 
not agree ess All arch1tects, like ac· 
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tors, become typecast. One cannot 
hear Mles' name without the Image of 
the skyscraper and Its corner coming 
to mind and In the same way, Wrlght Is 
associated with water falling off 
parapets. Thus the mention of Odd· 
swlth's name evokes rumlnatlons on 
man's best friend. 

In 1952 at the age of 71, Wag and his 
mother moved from New York City to 
Callfornlal211 They settled In Big Sur. 
Wag built himself a retreat near San 
Slmeon and wore bobby sox to work. He 
had developed the habit of thumping 
his right leg In pleasure and some say 
he pawed his drawings. Moreover, he 
always filled his office with dog· 
toothed violets and he was still a 
wizard at the board. Wag, like Ray­
mend Lowey, designed anything and 
everything. He seemed to have a 
natural ability to get to the essence of 
things. In his last years he designed 
his own cologne, well-known under the 
trademark 'FIDO', which had, accor· 
dlng to Mrs. Neutra, a very attractive 
scent although it did have a baffling 
tendency to attract dogs In heat. I 
noticed this at the Neutras' last 
party1221 

In 1965 at 84 Oddswlth designed his 
own crypt with a resting place for his 
dogs and his mother. He then had 
himself 'put down'. As in life, Oddswith 
died In a dignified manner and with 
authority. On his crypt Is inscribed: 
I AM LESS AT ODDSWITH MYSELF 
NOW THAN I HAVE EVER BEEN. 



NOTES 

1. I have hesitated to make claims for 
W. Oddswlth's work up to now because 
he was a close friend of mine. I 
presumed that he would be given pro­
per treatment by the new wave of ar­
chitectural historians. But pattence 
has Its limits. Shame on you Reyner 

2. Iona Oddswlth, nee Iona Shetland 
Dumfermline was famous for her 
research on the use of 'dum fries' In the 
treatment of Klrkcubrlghts disease of 
the brain. She was also my cousin. 
Thus I had the great personal pleasure 
of watching Wag staff develop Into a ar· 
chltect of the first rank. 

3. Abbreviations used: EPA, cis - 5, 8, 
11, 14, 17 - Elcosapentaenolc acid; 
GABA, Y-Amlnobutyrlc acid; 5-HETE, 
S(S) - Hydroxy-6-trans, 8, 11 , 14, • cis -
elcosatetraenolc acid; 12-H ETE, 12(S)­
Hydrosy • 5, 8, 14 - cls, 10 · trans -
elcosatetraenoic acid; LTA 5, 6- Oxldo 
- 7, 9 · trans, 11, 14 - cls -
elcosatetraenolc acid (also: 
leukotriene A); 14, 15 • LTA, 14, 15 -
Oxido-triene that serves as In­
termediate in pathwa of formation of 8, 
15 • LTB and 14, 15- LTB; LTB, respec­
tively. 

4. SOME, Journal de la socl~6 of­
flclelie du movement eclectic, Paris, 
novembre 1905. 

5. Oddswith used an elegant 
elongated saw tooth motif for his fur­
nishings and for his glass and there 
was, as a result, a very vertical and 
geometric feeling to the whole ensem­
ble. 

6. Adolf Loos, the acerbic German 
theorltlclan and Schinkelophlle was a 
visiting critic. 

7. See PIONEERS OF MODERN JOGG· 
ING, from W.A.T. Oddswlth to Adidas, 
Nlkolaus Footpath, Pelican. 1968. 

8. it may be of Interest to Montreal 
readers that Stewart Henbest Cepper 
was an Invited critic at Wag's final 
review. Capper, later to be the first 
holder of the Sir Wllllam Macdonald 
chair of architecture at McGIII, was 
practlclng In Scotland and was at the 
time giving a special course of lectures 
upon architecture at the University of 
Edinburgh, from where he had 
graduated as Master of Arts with first 
class honours In classical literature 
before becomlno a student In the 
Ecole des Beaux-Arts In the studio of 
M.J.-L. Pascal, architect, member of 
the Institute of France. Stu left Wag's 
review early. Later (1913), Capper ln­
vltled Oddswlth to visit at McGIII but 
Wag turned down the opportunity 
because as he wrote "I just couldn't 
ask a dog to put up with your climate." 

JEJ 
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0 
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\lltftllllll 

9. These sketch books came Into my 
hands In a rather unexpected fashion. I 
was visiting R.B. In Los Angeles In the 
summer of '65 when we heard of 
Wagstaff's death at Big Sur. After the 
funeral I was asked by his executor to 
deliver all Oddswlth's personal effects 
to the Museum of Modern Art . Natural­
ly 1 was fascinated by the sketch books 
and decided to keep them for myself. 1 
also have some terrific furniture from 
his house, a painting or two, and his 
Bugattl. I set his dogs free. 

10. Gombrlch, The Sense of Order, 
Cornell U.P., 1979, page 4824. 

11. Calling Adolf a 'louse' caught on 
with the 'Ver Sacrum' crowd who had 
been at the station. Klimt attributes 
the venom of Loos' writing to this en­
counter. 

12. Roughly translated 'Ornament and 
Crime' Loos argues that ornament on 
buildings Is analogous to ornament on 
the body and equally debased. The 
Idea that ornament was a pagan 
manifestation (tribal body painting, 
tatoos, nose-rings and so on) and that 
the unadorned body was pure was 
prevalent amongst leading design 
theorists at the turn of the century. 
Loos seems to have overlooked the 
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fact that Oddswith was designing 
undecorated buildings except for the 
occasional muzzle or blue ribbon. 

13. Wag believed that man·s salvation 
lay In the study of dogs. There are 
parallels here with Allce Viin der 
Rohe's Interest In food and Waiter 
Groplus' interest In young cats. 

14. I have the complete collection of 
Wagstaff's letters which make very In­
teresting reading Indeed. 

15. lt Is my hope that some young 
scholars will take up this fertile field of 
enquiry. 

16. This first pooperscooper was com­
missioned by Wallls Slmpson as a 
peace offering for King George VI. The 
King was so Impressed with how well lt 
worked, and by Its elegallt appearance 
and feel, that he Invited Oddswith to 
Windsor for a royal weekend. Elizabeth 
suggested that a dog house was need­
ed for her doll-house. We all had a 
grand time. I wrote Walls to tell her all 
about it. 

17. For what other reason could 
Wagstaff's 'der Bauhundhaus' have 
been omitted? We know that Hlt­
chcock and Johnson had been In the 
Bauhundhaus. They were observed 
Besides, that was where the party was 
held. After more than a few drinks, 
everybody except Amy Vanderbullt had 
sung 'You're In the Bauhundhaus Now' 
and so on. 

18. This Incident is also mentioned In 
Fellcla Ungulst's 'The Joists of Sex' 
Athletic Press, 1933, p. 69. 

19. I agree with Philip. The food was 
awful. Wag had Insisted that his 
design for a hot hors-d'oeuvre be serv­
ed. A sausage In a roll. The now well· 
known and notorious helsshund or­
dinarily served steamed with mustard 
and relish 

20. I disagree entirely with Peter 
Frampton's argument that Oddswlth 's 
work was dogmatic. 

21 . Wag and his mother spent a good 
part of the Second World War at my 
villa In Antlbes. They stayed on and on 
until 1950 when on an inspiration I 
loaned them my condominium on Cen­
tral Park. They left N Y.C. for Celifomla 
when I arranged for Wag to get the 
commission to des1gn the sets and 
costumes for MGM s sequel to Lassie, 
'Lassie In the Dog House 

22. A lithe sliding glass walls had to be 
closed much to the Irritation of R.N. 

Davld Farley Is Director of the School 
of Urban Planning at McG/11 University. 
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LARCH ITECTURE 

SUR LE PAPIER 

"L'srt contests le rfle/, mais se ne 
derobe pas I lui. •· 

Albert Cam us, "L 'Homme Revolte" 
19511,p319 

par Lyse Gelinas 

L ars Lerup lnaugaurajt le 
serle de conferences 
presentees en 1981 a 

I'Unlverslte McGIII par la societe 
Alcan1• Son propos lllustrall son com­
bat pour !'architecture sur le m!me ter­
ra n Que ce ul de 1'6cnture, le., sur le 
papier Ses dessins sont l'objet d'une 
polem Que ssue du conflit que existe 
entre la :amllle, le tangage et l'ar· 
chllecture. 

Selon Lerup, I' architecture est un texte 
qui s'ecrit par lui m!me, sans auteur 
speclfioue dans le cootexte h1storique 
global. Ce 'texte' gravlte autour de 
deux aspects essentials, -lntimement 
lies: 11mage (symbole) re ~ au 
langage architectural base sur un 
ensemble de conventions et de tradi· 
lions dans un coote.te socia et 
culture! doone; et la tonne (contours) 
rellee oila structure de !'object {e1 ses 
materlaux) et a la perceptiOn de 
!'aspect vlsuel. 

Le projet typique, prMente par Lerup, 
sltue !'architecture, proprement dite, 
icl, la salle centrale qui aglt comme 
memolre de l'espace (!'Image), entre 
deux malsons de verre d'aspect tradl· 
tlonnel (la forme). A l'enterieur de cet 
ensemble, forme de deux pavilions de 
banlleue typiques relies par un ·piece 
d'archatecture', on remarque une ten· 
dance vers le aurr~hsme ou l'absurde 
des espaces ei des objets Qui animent 
ceux-<:1. 

Par exemple, souhgnoos le c6te ab· 
surde' (cootraire a la ralsoo d'un 
escatier Qui ne monte nulle part. d'une 
fen6tre qui, de la chambre des maitres, 
s'ouvre sur le corridor lnterieur, viol ant 
amsl tout pranclpe d1ntimite familiale; 
ou d'une balustrade Qui devle au­
dessus du vide de l'ouverture de 
l'escaher, ignorant toute r6gle de 
securlte. le caractere lnaollte de ces 
6lements viae a renouer un contact 
avec les ObJeta de la vie 'quotidienne' 
qu'on ne remarqueralt pas autrement, 
seton Lerup. Par contre, l'eapace n'est 

habitable qu'au prix d'une lutte 'quoti· 
dienne' contre la forme, de la part des 
usagers, la famllle, alors que !'image 
se veut cooventionnelle. 

Le projet de Lerup s'appule sur des 
elements archltecturaux non fonction· 
nels. Ce principe est egalement illustre 
par le travail de Dejan Eclmovlc avec 
son architecture fondamentale qui 
utilise les elements de base. la col· 
onne, lemur, la poutre, l'escaller com­
ma des mots pour creer des phrases 
qui a'exprlment en tant que formes 
purea sans fonctlon lmplicite.2 La 
auasl, il s'aglt d'une architecture qui 
s'exprime princlpalement sur le papler 
comme celle de Lerup. 

11 taut aussl soullgner la serie de 
malsons de Peter Elaenmen (House IV, 
par example), qui est concerne par 
la nature fondamentale des relations 
entre lea plans {mura), les lglnes (col· 
onnea), et res volumes {cubes). L'ap­
proche aystematlque de Elsenman 
(House Ill, par example) eat fortement 
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influencoo par la thoorle llnguistlque. 
Pour lui, !'architecture est un langage 
dont les variations superficlelles 
(poesie) sont domlnees, comme en 
lingulstlque, par une structure (syn· 
taxe) sous-jacente. Blen que son ar· 
chltecture passe du dessln (archltec· 
lure sur le papler) A l'edlflce construit, 
a !'oppose de Lerup, Elsenman 
demeure davantage prooccupe par le 
vocabularie des composantes ar· 
chitectonlques pour en falre un 
langage architectural formal qui n'est 
pas impllcitement fonctionnel tout 
comma le langage de Lerup. 

La demarche lntellectuelle de Lerup 
rejolnt !'attitude crllatrlce qui com­
p16te !'existence absurde telle que 
dllflnle par Albert Cemua.3 11 est 
necessalre de preciser la notion d'ab­
surde dans le contexte exlstentlallste. 
Le sentiment d'absurdlte nail du 
divorce entre l'homme et son deslr 
d'expllquer et de comprendre par sa 
ralson, et l'unlvers Inexplicable et 
deralsonnable lssu de caractere lnhu· 

; 
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main (ou non human) du monde et 
l 'lrreductlblllte, l'lnsalslssable de ce 
monde et des autres ~tres. L'homme 
absurde se retrouve seu l dans 
l 'unlvers, sans espolr de trouver une 
verlte pour eruclder le mystilre opaque 
du monde qui l'entoure. La croyance A 
l'absurde est en effet opposee A cella 
du sens A la vie. Par consequent, 
l 'homme vlt sans appal comma l'exem­
ple qui reflilte le mleux sa condition, 
le., le condamne A mort. 

La sagesse dlfflclle de la pensee ab· 
surde s'exprlme par la creation 'pour 
rlen' ou l'auteur salt sa creation sans 
aven lr et est consclemment Indifferent 
de savolr qu'elle puisse 6tre lnutile. 
Toute oeuvre, salon la conception ex­
lstentlallste de l 'absurde, est une col­
lection d '~hecs (efforts valns) exprl­
mant et repetant !'Image de la condl· 
lion humaine, le. son caratilre mortel. 
La lucidlte de l 'homme absurde exlge 
une revolte permanente contre sa con­
dition, perseverant dans un effort qu'll 
salt sterile mais qui permet A l'homme 
d'approcher un peu plus sa rea lite nue. 

Cette lutte qu i semble inutlle rejoin! 
cella de Lerup et son architecture sur 
le papler (qui n'asplre pas A se con­
cretlser) a base d'elements non fonc· 
tionnels, done sterlles. Par le fait 
m~me, 11 exprlme la reallte pro fonde de 
la condition humalne au niveau de son 
'architecture', se rapprochant alnsi de 
l'homme absurde de Cam us pour qui la 
creat ion est la discipline ideale qui 
permet de malntenir une conscience 
evelllee au x Images du mon de 
deraisonnable qu'il est futile de tenter 
d'expliquer. 

11 s 'aglt done d'exprlmer l'inexpllcable 
de reel comme lorsque Lerup met en 
lumlilre les elements de la vie quotl­
dlenne, escaller, balustrade, fen~tre, 
etc., en leur rendant leur charactere ln­
sollte original, le. avant qu'il solent 
manlpules et rationalises par l'homme 
pour les rendre fonctlonnels, alors 
qu'lls ne sont encore que des 'mots'. SI 
Lerup demeure un archlt ecte sur le 
papler, sans realisation concrete, c'est 
que le createur absurde cree sans ap­
pal ... 

11 reste a se demander jusqu'a quel 
point l 'archltectura sur la papler ou 'la 
creat ion absurde' peut ~tre conslderee 
en tant qu'archltecture au sens propre 
du mot: "l'art de construlre les 
lktlflces" (definition du dlctlona~re). 
L'archltecture de Lerup est davantage 
ldeologlque en tant que forme 
d'ecrlture graphlque et sans resultat 
pragmatlque sous forme d'edifice qui 
pourralt lllustrer ses prlnclpes. 

C 'est vralment une lutte au niveau d'un 
langage, que milne Lerup, et qui, sans 
~Ire verltablement archltectonlque, est 
plutOt phllosophlque. Le debat est au 
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niveau des Idees et non des 6difices. 
En fin, on asslste A une remise en ques­
tion des rea lites architecturales afin de 
s'eloigner du modele ratione! fausse­
ment renconfortant (le 'saut' selon 
Cam us) des edifices fonctlonnels, pour 
aborder le domaine d'une architecture 
de l'absurde Issue d'une lucidite ex­
treme face a la condition humalne 
sans salut spiritual. 

Lyse Gellnas est une ~tudlante 8 
/'eco/e d'arch/tecture de McGI/1 Unver­
slty 

Notes 
1. Lerup, Lars "On his work", dans le 

cadre des conferences Architecture 
Alcan 1981 , presentees a I'Univer­
slte McGlll el 10 fevrier 1981 Lars 
Lerup est professeur adjomt en ar­
chitecture 6 I'Universite de Califor­
nia 6 Berkeley et 6 ~rlt Buildmg 
thtt Unfinished Sage Publications 
Inc., 1977 

2. ~clmovic, Oejan. " Primary Ar· 
chltecture", dans Architectural 
Design 51 , 5-1981. p37-38. 

3. Camus, Albert la mythe de 
Slsyphe. Collection Idees. Editions 
Galllmard, Paris, 1942. 186pp. 
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CYCLOTRONS 
by Derek L. Livesey 

P • hyslclsts do not often occupy 
themselves with planning 
cities or designing objects of 

architectural quality. The great excep­
tion was S1r Chrlstopher Wren, who 
was contributing significantly to the 
science of mechanics when the CHy or 
London was being rebuilt after the 
Great Fire of 1666. Rarely does a great 
architect seize nis opportumty w1th 
such alac.rrty as Wren, who presented 
his new clty plan to the King wlthm ten 
days of the fire's erupt ion, bef()(e the 
city had ceased to smoulder. In the 
event, of course, h1s Idealistic city plan 
was never carried ou1 but his genius 
found full expression in the rebuilding 
ol the City churches and St. Paul's 
cathedral. 

Physics does not necesarlly Impose a 
uniQue design upon large structures, 
as la shown by the diversity of designs 
for massl11e bridges. One Important ex-

ceptlon Is the construction of high­
energy particle accelerators which 
have reachoo kilometre dimensions 
and costs In the billion dollar range. 
The two accelerators of highest energy 
(located In Illinois and near Geneva) 
are not very Interesting to look at, 
though they represent high-precision 
englneenng on the largest possible 
scale. Each consists of a ring-shaped 
tunnel of Immense radius, contaming 
an apparently endless series of 
magnets, enclosing an evacuated tube 
through which the accelerated par­
t icles fly. At present, the highest 
energy ach i eved with protons 
(hydrogen nuclei) is 400,000 Me V, 
equivalent to accelerat ing each parti· 
cle through a potential difference of 
400,000,000,000 volts. 

By comparison, some of the earliest 
electrostatic accelerators, wor1<1ng at 
potential& of less than a million volts, 

FIG. 2 

were works of art. Just some fifty years 
ago Cockcroft and Walton In Cam­
bridge. England used a simple array of 
capacitors and diodes to multiply a 
few thousand volts (alternating input) 
up to a final (rectified) potential of 
600.000 volts. This voltage could be ap­
plied to accelerate protons down an 
evacuated tube to ground potential 
where the proton beam struck a lithium 
target, producing nuclear reactions in 
abundance. The Cockcroft -Walton set 
s still used for the first stage of beam 

production In high-energy accelerators 
and Its generating stack (Fig. 1) has a 
characteristic profile In which bulbous 
metal shields form the Intermediate 
electrodes and the diagonal tubes 
house the rectifying diodes. In such a 
stack the electrical circuit actually die· 
tates the essential design and high­
voltage practice determines the 
outline. 

Almost simultaneously with the work 
of Cockcroft and Walton, Lawrence 
and Livlngston (Fig. 2) were able to syn­
chronize the acceleration pulses with 
the particle orbits and achieve 
repeated acceleratlons The protons 
started off at very low energy at the 
centre of the chamber and would even­
tually leave by an exit port at energies 
around five mill ion electron volts (5 
Me V). 

At first sight, 11 would appear that the 
cyclotron principle must work up to 
very high energies, limited only by the 
size and strength of the available 
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FIG. 3 

magnets. Unfortunately, the first 
generation of cyclotrons (built In the 
1930's) suffered from poor beam quali­
ty and their low reliability compared to 
that of the electrostatic machines. The 
author has vivid memories of running 
the cyclotron at Liverpool in the 1940's 
and the perpetual struggles to keep the 
beam on target (or anywhere near lt). 
Already by 1940 it seemed that there 
might be no second generation of 
cyclotrons at all, because lt could be 
shown from Einstein's Theory of 
Relativity that the Increasing mass of a 
particle at speeds approaching the 
speed of light causes a de-tuning of 
the cyclotron acceleration process and 
that the effective maximum proton 
energy was about 20 MeV. 

However, In 1945, MacMIIIan and 
Veksler Independently proved that the 
acceleration In the relativistic (high­
energy) region Is quite feasible if the 
particles are handled In bunches By 
starting off a bunch of protons at low 
energy (with the appropriate ac­
celerating frequency) and then chang­
Ing the frequency of electrical oscllla 
lion as the particle speed Increases, 1t 
Is possible to keep the particle energy 
continually Increasing until the final 
extraction energy Is reached . Again the 
size of the magnet Is a limitation but 
Lawrence had already built the enor­
mous 184 Inch (pole diameter) magnet 
at Berkeley and this magnet was used 
In the first high-energy cyclotron. The 
machine Is housed In a simple dome­
covered building on the hill overlooking 

the campus of the University of Califor­
nia. Unfortunately, one cannot normal­
ly see the essential outline of the 
machine (Fig 3) because it Is hidden 
behind tons of concrete shielding 
blocks. After several re-vamptngs, the 
beam energy was raised to 720 MeV 
and this Is still the record high energy 
for a cyclotron. The 184 inch machine 
has made immense contributions to 
the discovery of new particles and their 
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FIG. 4 

properties. 

The frequency-modulated cyclotron 
caught on In the late 1940's and, 
among many machines of this type, 
one must single out the 100 MeV 
machine In the Foster Radiation 
Laboratory on the McGIII Uni._erslty 
campus (Ag. 4). Although not a world· 
beater In energy, the McGIII cyclotron 
has been remarkably sound in perfor-

FIG. 5 
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mance and it Is still in use for the pro­
duction of new nuclear species and of 
isotopes for blo..med~eal research. 

The freQuency·modulated cyclotron 
unfortunately has Its drawbacks, 11" e 
any design. A minor problem is the ex­
traction of the high~nergy beam from 
the magnetic l1eld region In order to 
direct the particles to an external 
target. The major drawback •s the low 
beam Intensity (measured as average 
beam current) caused by the necessity 
of accelerating the particles in bun­
ches. The latest generation of 
cyclotrons Is based on a princ1ple 
diSCovered by Thomas in 1938. The 
relativistic region can be reached with 
essentially continuous beam operation 
(fixed-frequency oscillation) by modfy­
lng the magnetic field to produce 
powerful focussing In the central plane 
of the vacuum chamber. This Idea was 
first tried out by bolting sector-shaped 
plates to the pole laces of a Lawrence 
cyclotron, producing regions of high 
f1eld strength (' Hllls'1 alternatmg w1th 
regions of low f1ela ("Val!eys'1- The 

FIG. 7 

new f1eld pattern Is Illustrated by a 
three-<! mensional pecspect ve of the 
f'eld variatiOn In the South African 
cyclotron now being built near 
Capetown (Fig. 5). 

At tn ls stage a barOQue element enters 
the architecture of cyclotrons 
because, as higher and higher energ1es 
are attamed In the Thomas type of 
cyclotron. the magnetic fleld becomes 
more and more bizarre, w1th spiral· 
shaped sectors producing the "hill " 
fields. The most asymmetric design 
realized to date is that of TRIUMF, a 
500 Me V machine located In Vancouver 
and In operation since 1974. Each of 

the six major sectors of the magnet 
consists of a pair of poles, with 
horizontal spiral-sector plates backed 
by extraordinary steel-plate 
assemblies above and below the pole 
plates proper. ln (Fig. 6) we see the test 
assembly of one palf of poles in the 
shop at tHe Oavie Shlpbuildtng Co. in 
Lauzon, Quebec. The complete 4000 
ton magnet was shipped in pieces by 
rail to Vancouver and then began the 
complex task of assembling the entire 
structure In the accelerator vault 
When all the lower pole faces were in 
place a picture was taken of the con­
struction and design staff draped over 
the steel work (Fig. 7). Then the im-
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mense vacuum chamber (56 feet in 
diameter) was installed and the upper 
pole assembly was fixed to a large sup­
port structure which spans the entire 
magnet. Another major task was the in· 
stallation of the water-cooled 
alumlnum coils (each carrying a cur­
rent of 27,000 amperes) which provide 
the excitation for the magnet struc­
ture. 

Some Idea of the machine scale and its 
features may be obtained from the 
view shown In (Fig. 6). Around the cir · 
cum ference of the cyclotron are twelve 
jacks which, working In un ison, lift the 
entire upper support structure, the up­
per pole pieces and the top half of the 
vacuum tank when inspection of the In­
side is required . This feature of the 
design was a practical necessity In the 
early stages of adjustment to the Inner 
electrodes and the vacuum system, but 
the extremely high rad ioactive 
background set up In the tank by full· 
beam operation makes Inspections 
very hazardous and remote-control 
devices are needed to make ad· 
justments during regular operation. 

Another remarkable feature of TRIUMF 
is that the accelerated particles are 
not protons (H + Ions), as Is usual In 
hlgh~nergy machines, but negative 
hydrogen Ions (H·) In which a proton is 
bound to two electrons. The advantage 
of H· operation Is that at any suitable 
point In the vacuum tank the beam can 
be Intercepted (either wholly or partial· 
ly) by a thin carbon foil fixed to a 
moveable probe. The Ions lose their 
electrons on Impact with the foil and 
are Instantly converted Into H + 
patlcles, which are ejected from the ac­
celeration region by the magnetic field . 
In lhls way essentially 100% of the 



FIG. 8 
beam may be extracted at any energy 
from about 100 MeV to 500 MeV. 
Moreover, part of the beam can be ex­
tracted at one energy while the rest of 
the particles continue to higher 
energies. In actual operation TRIUMF 
provides up to three working beams at 
one time, thereby keeping many ex­
perimenters simultaneously happy. 
The penalty paid for this extra feature 
of the TRIUMF cyclotron Is the require­
ment that the highest magnetic field 
strength Is comparatively low and the 
magnet diameter becomes extremely 
large. 

At the time of writing, two major 
cyclotrons (one in Vancouver and one 
near Zurich) are working In the 500 Me V 
region, with special attention paid to 
the properties of artlclflally produced 
particles such as pions and muons. In 
addition, a machine at the University of 
Indiana, designed originally for 200 
MeV protons and other light particles, 
has been converted to accelerate 
heavy Ions (nuclei of elements much 
heavier than hydrogen). In passing one 
should mention that the South African 
cyclotron, which Is rather similar to the 
Indiana machine, will be dovoted large­
ly to medical applications. Small 
cyclotrons (In the region of 50 MeV pro· 
ton energy) are available commercially 
and one Is now being Installed on the 
TRIUMF site purely for the purpose of 
radio-Isotope production. 

The extension of cyclotron design to 
new fields Is still under way. Some 
blueprints of a super-TRIUMF have 
been sketched out, with the Intention 
of Injecting the TRIUMF beam Into a 
so-called Kaon factory (code·name 
CANUCK) which Is a very strange 
magnet Indeed. At the other extreme a 

beautiful small cyclotron has been 
built at Chalk River to accelerate heavy 
Ions to high energies and this machine 
has the special feature of a very high 
magnetic field generated by supercon­
ducting coils (Immersed In liquid 
helium). A similar accelerator Is work­
Ing at Michigan State University and 
the Chalk River facility Is expected to 
become operational in 1983 

Is there any kind of aesthetic Influence 
on the design of a complex machine 
such as a cyclotron? Nowadays ac­
celerators are designed by committees 
and the results often resemble the 
ungainly camel rather than the elegant 
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cheetah. To mention a specific exam· 
pie, the problem of raising the upper 
half of the TRIUMF cyclotron (welgh1ng 
about 2000 tons) In one piece was 
solved by welding together the twelve­
member support structure seen In (Fig. 
9). 1t would have been more elegant to 
use a pre-stressed concrete dome (like 
Wren's airy dome for St. Paul's 
cathedral) but height limitations In the 
cyclotron vault rendered a flat struc· 
lure necessary. In the event the 
assembly of the support structure was 
a major headache and it had unfor­
tunate effects on the magnetic field In 
the central region. 

A related question Is the degree of 
complexity required for a successful 
cyclotron design. The original macnlne 
was beautifully simple, as designed by 
Lawrence, but the beam quality was 
never satisfactory and there were great 
difficulties In operation. As lime went 
by. the cyclotron became more and 
more sophisticated and it eventually 
joined the ranks of precision 
machines. A parallel argument con­
cerns the humble bicycle, which Is con· 
ceptually very simple but now requires 
elaborate factory techniques for 
satisfactory fabrication. Sad to say, 
elegant simplicity of design does not 
always make for mechanical efficien­
cy. The modern tendency In ac· 
celerators Is to use a powerful com­
puter to monitor the machine perfor­
mance and to apply numerous small 
corrections during operation. Not the 
most elegant strategy but extremely ef­
ficient. 

Dr. Derek Uvesey is Professor of 
Physics at the University of New 
Brunswtck. 

FIG. 9 
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Crossword 
by Oavld Mario Covo 

ACROSS 

3. Well41.nown house on Park Avenue 
5. Architect Franools left his name 

on the skyline 
11. M athemat lcal model for 'circular' 

stair 
13. Many do it In their home, thrice 

dany 
14.Cantllevered support. by a mason 
15. PrehiStoric but highly ad'lanced 

c1vf1tzatton of Crete 
16. Liverpool Cathedral compet&tion 

winner (Initials) 
17.Sacrlhce: position in sequence of 

1 down 
19.Number six In J.R.'s list 
21 . Perta&ns to chimneys and plumb-

Ing vents 
25. Few arch&tects buDd their own 
27.Commoo soflwood 
29 The chair he and Eero designed 

bears his name (initials) 
30.Fiatrron's designer, to his ' riends 
31 . Escalator direction 
33. Type or English house. for short 
J.1.0ne or the 'big three' In descrip-

tive geometry 
35.Point foundation 
36. Washington Gallery designer (in-

Itials) 
37. Apples and elevators 
39 Beach house prospect 
43. Holography tool 
45.Architrave, frieze and cornice 
45.Vertlcal component of 47 down 
49. Threatened Park Avenue churcn 
51. Engineer's concerns 
52. Post-grad degree for the 'practical­

minded' 
53. The monks of Samte Mane de la 

Toure1te were his clients 
56.A detached colonnade, n Athens 
58. Postijrad degree for the green-

thumb' 
59. Well-known London school 
60.Guggenhe&m's architect, initially 
61 . Russtan Construcltvlst, to his 

friends 
62 see 51 across 
64. Fmd 1t In a window-box In 

Toulouse 
65. Ruskln again, on the Adriattc 
67.Used with daub, in timber frame 
69.Comes from taps in 33 across 
71. J J P. of de Stljl 
73.Two words, goes wfth 34 across 
75. Why the apprentice works With the 

master 
77. Walter's well·known haus 
78. Tall structure, often polygonal, ter­

minates In a point 
79.Use it to support 78 acrcss on a 

square base 
80. Classical order from Asia M1nor 

DOWN 

1.Ruskln's illuminating d ·g t 
2.Ground floor, to some 
4. Where the sun rises, In Paris 
5.Arch&tect Charles and sculptor 

Henry 
6. Versatile and changeable, but can 

be hard to clean 
?. Metals used in combination 
a. Features of a Persian sky! ne. for 

example. 
9.Attraction for residents of 68 down 

10.Sides of a bastion, military 
12. Dart's moulding partner 
18. Rough masonry, Irregularly laid 
19. Raised part of a battlement 
20. Pointed four-center arch featuring 

double-cuNes 
22.Collaborated w1th Utzon on 

Sydney's Opera 
23. Describes stair of 11 across 
24. Popular with Dutch gardeners 
25.Race tracks In ancient Greece 
26. Simplest form of arched roof 
28. Landmartt by Shreve, Lamb and 

Harmon 
29. They manage the world's tallest 

freestanding structure 
32. Factor tor calculation of tread wid· 

ths of 23 down 
37. Dark space under certain homes 
38. Where most schemes are built 
40.Carpenter's tool , once upon a time 
41 .M9dfum used with 6 down 

42. Welding type 
44.American professional body 
47. Ups and downs of low-rise con-

struction 
48.Aicove 
49.A client of Oddswith, via Schulz 
50. Empire builders loved a good bath 
54. Sun god, Egyptian 
55. Common rural structure 
56. Counties have them, but everyone 

uses one notwithstanding 
57 Fluorescent tube, in Holland 
63. Domed Buddhist structures 
64.Columns sit on lt, and sometimes 

walls 
66. Low-gloss paint finish 
67.Ancestral origins of 60 across? 
68. Popular urban dwellings 
70. The well-dresssed cornerstone 
72 German article associated with 

Mies 
74. Specialized medical unit (abbrevia­

tion) 
76. Common medium of heat transfer 
77 Energy effic ient gas produced by 

anaerobic digestion 

Dsv/d Covo IS Associate Professor st 
the School of Architecture st McG/11 
University. 
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THESIS, McGILL UNIVERSITY, SPRING 1982 
A COMPETITION: THE CANADIAN CHANCERY IN 
WASHINGTON, D.C. Randy Cohen 

Architectural ideas in competition. Competition in Architecture. 
The idea of a building accepting the determinating form of the city 
fabric, and contrasting this with the contrived form of the court . 
The material quality of stone, a stone mass cut into, its weight car· 
rying to the ground. Spaces thus formed . Each elbowing, no· carv· 
ing , chiseling (?) the form. The form. Everything. Yes, form is 
everything. Contrast. The contrast between inside and out. The In· 
wardness of inside being out. Inside-out. Abstract versus real. 
What is real? Classical versus modern. If modernism is abstract, is 
classicism real? Abstraction is everything. Thus, one can say that 
form is abstraction can 't they? 

I I 

I I 
• 

/ 
/ 

(Randy Cohen received a Bechelor of Architecture degree from the School of Archttectufl1 at McGl/1 University In 1982}. 
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Canadian Embassy· Washington D. C. 
A Fourth Year Project 

University of Waterloo 
Winter 1982 
Matt Smith 

Basle Prwnlu 

An embassy, any embassy, is an exten· 
sion of that country's people, and their 
respective government. The bulldmg 1s 
mostly an extens1on of the democrat1c 
government's functions abroad, but 
also, serves as a symbolic device 
representing the ideals and asplra· 
lions of the country's people. 

The most Important aspect of the em· 
bassy, which Is not recognized by 
Modem Architecture, Is the ritual, 
pomp and ceremony. 

The project shown here 1s a building 
that follows the premise lt recogrtizes 
the public and the users of the bu1td•ng 
with the part/ for tne building being 
partly developed upon th•s. Also 
recognized, Is the need to maKe the 
building visually accessible. Above all, 
lt Is a build ng that Is Architecture of 
the Publ1c Rearm. 

The Site 

Pennsylvania Avenue with its classical 
flavour suits the ceremonial nature of 
the avenue, which Is the lnaugauratlon 
Parade route between Capitol Hill and 
the White House. it Is this avenue that 
the Canad1an Embassy addresses, and 
that 1t must respond to. 

The Building 

This Is a building that recognizes the 
public reeim and the Idea of syi'Ttx>l. 1t 
la a bulldtng that unfolds a narrative to 
a person travelling through it, but also 
Includes the principles of ritual and 
ceremony for that traveller and not just 
for the dtgnitaries. 

The bulldiog uses vertically a tripartite 
organization having a base, body, and 
head. Thts permitted a flexible max· 
lmlzatlon or the building's programme, 
which was divided Into parkil'g and 
support, embassy offices and public 
areas. 

Pennsylvania Avenue Elevation 
The base contains parking for visitors 
and embassy staff along with an in· 
terlor passenger drop off to comple· 
ment the passenger drop oft on Penn· 
sylvanla Avenue. 

Moving through the body of the 
building, events unfold to the traveller 
unlike most modern government 
buildings. Hallways having a hip type 
ceiling provide a sense of travel and of 
destination. 

L:lghtwells are used within the body to 
provide both light fOf Interior offices 
and as a point of reference and relief 
for the traveller of the bulldmg. 11 1s 
from the light wells that access to each 
of the embassy office areas occurs 
and these entrances are demarcated 
by a pediment and vestibule. 

Unlike most buildings that have public 
areas within their programme, the 
public areas of this building are not on 
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the entry level but are contained within 
the head of the building. 

This was done for two reasons: I) the 
symbolism associated with an em· 
bassy; and it) the episodic potential of 
having the public areas at the top of 
the building. 

First, the embassy Is a type of govern­
ment office building with larger public 
areas than most. As a result of this, the 
symbolic nature of the building dlc· 
tated that the offices support the 
public areas and not the reverse. 

Second, by having the public areas of 
the embassy at the top of the building 
part of the building that would not have 
been utilized, the roof, can now be in· 
corporated with the narrative psrtl of 
the building. Washington during a 
summer evening Is a wondrous sight 
with all of Its public buildings bathed 
In light and the experimental artists on 
the Mall exhibiting their 'works of the 
night'. 
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Preliminary Studies for a Country House 1982 

Peter Rose Architect 

Sketches by Eridl Morosi 

Pencil on Yellow Trace 
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COMPETITIONS: 

Efficient Home Competition. 
The Canadian Housing Design Coun· 
ell, Atlantic Region, Is sponsoring an 
Invited competition to design an 
energy·efflclent, expendable starter 
home. Open only to current Term 5 
st udents at Technical University of 
Nova Scotla. From August 2 to 
September 10. 

CONFERENCES & 
WORKSHOPS: 
Energex 1982 Energy Conference and 
Exposition. 
Theme: the effective Integration of 
energy Into a nation's quest for energy 
self·rellance with consideration being 
given to the technical, economic and 
human dimensions. August 23 to 29: 
University of Reglna, Saskatchewan. 

Planning for the Layman. 
Continuing Education, University of 
Calgary. September 27 and 28, 
7:30·9:30 pm. $30.00 

Edward Culllnan, London Architect will 
con duct a week·long series of 
workshops on five of his projects. Par· 
t lcl p atlon b y regist r ation only. 
September 27 to October 1: Technical 
University of Nova Scotia, Halifax. 

4th lntematlonal Conference on Urban 
Design. 
Theme: The Kinetic City: Movement 
and the Urban Environment. October 
13 to 16: Toronto, Ontario. Contact: In· 
st ltute for Urban Design, Main P.O. Box 
105, Purchase, New York 10577. 

Assoc i ation fo r Preservation 
Technology 1982 Annual Conference. 
New and developing technologies and 
processes as well as technical and ad· 
mlnlstratlve approaches. October 24 to 
27: Banff, Alberta. 

EXHIBITIONS: 
Etchlngs and Lithography by Ar· 
chltects. 
Featuring: Richard Meier, Aldo Rossl , 
Mlchael Graves, Masslmo Scolarl, 
Franco Purlnl, Raymond Abraham. 
From June 1: Ballenford Bookstore, 98 
Scollard Street, Toronto. 

Site · Specific Environment Art. 
Social, architectural, geographic and 
historic significance of an area In 
which sculpture Is to be Installed by: 
Melvln Charney ('A Toronto Construe· 
lion', 139 King St. E.), Robert 
Stackhouse ('The Toronto Project', 149 
King St. E.) and Nancy Hott ('Cat· 
chbasln', Jarvls and Adelaide Streets) 
From June 25: Market Gallery, 95 Front 
Street East , Toronto. Wed · Frl 
10:00·5:00, Sat 9:00·5:00, Sun 2:00-5:00. 

Toronto Faculty of Architecture & 
Landscape Architecture. 
Exhibition series: 
Student Work 1981-82: Student Pro· 
jects from the Faculty, Ends 
September 10. 
Gardens of Spain, September 13 to Oc· 
tober 1. 
Urban Design, October 4 to 15. 
Swiss Architecture, October 18 to 
November 5 

To Scale. 
Archive maps selected from the 
elghteenth·century to the present day. 
August 21 to October 3: Market 
Gallery, 95 Front Street East, Toronto. 

Interventions Series. 
A Bernard Tschumi Installation. Mid­
September: A Space, 299 Queen St. W. 
& Ballenford Bookstore, 98 Scollard 
Street , Toronto. 

Wat ertoo School of Architecture and 
Department of Fine Arts Alumnl Exhlbl· 
tlon. 
Includes original drawings and models 
by Waterloo architecture alumni. Oc· 
tober 28 to December 12: Centre for the 
Arts Gallery, Waterloo, Ontario. 

Technical University of Nova Scotla 
Faculty of Architecture. 
Exhibition series: 
Pick of the Projects. 
An exhibition of student work from 
Terms 3, 4, 5 and 8. August 23 to 
September 17. 
Jose Luls Sert. 
A major travelling exhibition of photos 
and drawings. September 20 to Oc· 
tober 8. 
Cont exts. 
An exhibition from the Boston office of 
Moshe Safdle. October 11 to 29. 
Unplanned and Unbullt. 
An exhibition from the Toronto office 
of AJ Diamond & Associates 
November 1 to 19. 
Drawings. 
An exhibition from the office of Ba rd & 
Sampson, Toronto. 
November 22 to December 10. 

Percy Eraklne Nobbs= Architect, Artist, 
Craftsman. 
A major retrospective on the early 20th· 
century Montreal architect on loan 
from the McCord Museum In Montreal 
(see Review In this Issue). October: 
Ring House Gallery, University of 
Alberta, Edmonton. 

Pieces of Pictures. 
A select1on of details of nineteenth· 
century photographs of city scenes 
from the renowned Nottman 
Photographic Archives, Ends 
September: McCord Museum 690 
Sherbrooke Street West, Montreal. 

Regards sur Montreal. 
Exposlt lon/vente: les rues et les 
ruelles, l'anclen et le nouveau, de la 
montagne au fleuve. Gravures , 
aquarelles et autres techniques. Ter· 
mlnera le 5 septembre: Le Centre Ur· 
bain. H~rttaoe Montr~al. 406 Notre 
Dame est Montreal. lun·dim 
13hQ0.17hOO. 

Jack Lenor Larsen: 30 Years of 
Creative Textiles 
On tour from the Mus~e des arts 
decorat1fs In Paris, retrospect of 
Larsen's work In clothmg design and 
deocratlng as well as architecture. In 
six parts. Materials and Techniques 
Pattern Coordination, Colour, Commis· 
slons, Uses of the Past, and Towards 
the Future. Ends August 22: Montreal 
Museum of Decorative Arts, Le 
Chateau Dufresne, corner Sherbrooke 
& Pie IX, Montreal. Thu·Sun 12:00-5:00. 

Marcel Breuer: Fumlture and lnterfors. 
Organized by The Museum of Modem 
Art (New York), the th1rd In a series of 
MoMA exhibitions on 20th-<:entury 
designers whose work has had a pro· 
found effect on our times. (F1rst two 
were on Charles Eames (1973) and Lud· 
wig Mles van der Rohe (1977); last two 
w 11 be on Alvar Aalto and Le 
Corbusier.) September 16 to October 
31 · Montreal Museum of Decorative 
Arts. the Chateau Dufresne corner 
Sherbrook.e & Pie IX, Montreal. Open 
Thu·Sun 12:()().5;00. 

LECTURES: 
If There Is a Relationship Between the 
Architect ure of the City and that of 
Buildings • What Is lt? 
Fall Lecture Series at the Faculty of Ar· 
chltecture, Technical University of 
Nova Scotia, Halifax. 
September 30: Edward Cu i inan, Lon· 
don 
October 7: Kenneth Frampton, Colum· 
bia University, NY. 
October 14' Edmund Bacon (tentative), 
Philadelphia. 
October 21: Rene Menkes, Webb 
Zerafa Menkes, Toronto. 
October 28: Sydney Bregman, 
Bregman & Haman, Toronto. 
November 4: Ray Affleck, AACOP, 
Montreal. 
November 18: Jack Diamond, Toronto. 
November 25: Barry Sampson, Balrd & 
Sampson, Toronto 
December 2; Melvln Charney, Montreal. 
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CORPORATE PATRONS 
Domtar 
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Marianne McKenna, Toronto 
John Meunier, Clnclnnatl USA 
Mill & Ross, Kingston 
Leslle Mucclno, Toronto 
Michel G. Nadeau, Laval 
Sherry Olson, Montreal 
Alan E. Orton, Polnte-Cialre 
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