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Leon Krler was In Montreal In March 
1982. While in Montreal, Mr. Krier kindly 
agreed to take part In a discussion with 
McG/11 architecture students. The 
following is the transcript of part of that 
discussion. 

L 
eon Krier. We have reached a 
stage which is very difficult to 
cope with, where· virtually· educa· 

lion ignores the main Issues of the pro· 
blems we cause through the system we 
have established with nature. And I 
think that city planning and, in the end, 
architecture are maybe the pivotal in· 
struments in the destruction of country 
and city and of our values ·which have 
been established over a very long 
period of time and which have been 
taken for granted by the last five or six 
generations. 

I do not only mean politicians but also 
intellectuals and history responsible to 
people · which had to do with an at· 
titude that one always thought, 
'whatever we do, if we do it together, 
and with majority decisions, it will be 
alright. lt will be tine in the end even if 
there will be suffering in between, if 
some people will lose meanwhile. But in 
the end, the overall gain. historically, 
will be colossal and we can't possibly 
avoid going in that direction.' And now 
we see that, basically, majority deci· 
sions or committee decisions very often 
don't replace, or cannot replace, the 
moral responsibility of the individual. 
Quite the contrary. Very often majority 
decisions or committee decisions allow 
the individuals to completely give up 
their moral conscience and hide behind 
this anonymous concensus which final· 
ly is · and has shown to be · extremely 
destructive. And I think as an architect 
one is immensely involved In that pro­
cess of destruction. You automatically 
work in a system which is furthering 
this total devastation of the planet. And 
however carefully you do your work · I 
mean, you may design a very beautiful 
house· but JUSt the problem of design· 
ing a house in a certain system, plann· 
lng system, is, in my way, extremely 
destructive If you do not know exactly 
what you're doing. 

Now, I'm not trying to create moral pro· 
blems with slogans to be antl·capitallst 
because lt's not a problem of being 
antl·capltalist because lt's not a pro· 
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blem of being anti-capitalist or anti· 
Industrial or anti-anything. The real pro· 
blem Is that when you do something 
you have to be morally responsible tor 
lt. And there Is no excuse. I think the 
problem of capitalism Is certainly one 
but it's not the main problem because 
whatever system you claim to change 
capitalism or get rid of capitalism has 
never achieved that. Quite the contrary. 
lt has very much been Instrumental In 
radlcallzlng these tendencies towards 
pontlflcatlon of purely accounting 
values rather than moral values. Purely 
numerical values. And I don't know 
whether Industrialization Is a sign, a 
cause, or an effect of the moral 
decadence of the European and then 
the rest of the world. So sad. 

So one doesn't really know how it was 
possible suddenly to give up moral con· 
earns and principles which transcend· 
ed, really, epochs and cultures; which 
had nothing to do with being Christian 
or Jewish or Greek. But there was an 
essential concern which was always 
the same, I think, In our philosophy, In 
our theology. There was the same con· 
cern with the moral responsibility of the 
Individual. And suddenly, for that to be 
given up· I haven't found out yet what 
caused it and I don't think anybody real· 
ly has. 

This very great problem nobody . can 
solve, even Individually, because the 
education you get Is completely against 
this taking of responsibility. And also 
the modern conception of history Is 
really that the Individual doesn't, Is not 
able to, do anything against history; 
that history Is a big machine and it runs 
In one direction which we can't change 
and If you go outside that machine you 
Just make yourself a bit ridiculous. 

I think the fundamental problem came 
with the change In conception of the 
universe. From the Renaissance on· 
ward there was a very strong tendency 
to consider the universe as a machine; 
a very complex machine which we 
didn't understand yet entirely. But 
potentially there was a possibility for 
human Intelligence to understand the 
machine In all Its complexity, In all of Its 
parta, and at a certain moment to In· 
tervene In the working of the parts and 
alao In the overall construction of that 
machine. That was sustained, I mean, 
basically, by Descartes and by Newton 

but was also, I think, very much at the 
basis of thinkers like Hegel, maybe, and 
Marx. 

Another philosophy which I find terribly 
Important was that of one of the last 
great universal thinkers, I think, Lelb· 
nltz. Lelbnltz was a mathematician 
He's most famous for his development 
of calculus. He was very important in 
many matters. He was basically also a 
theologian and a philosopher and he 
criticized very strongly that mechanical 
concept of nature. He said however 
close or however far you look at nature 
you always see about the same amount 
of complexity; but the further you 
penetrate that complexity it will always 
reveal new complexity of the same 

order and of the same vastness. Even If 
you build the hugest machine, if you 
look at the Infinitely small, you will just 
see a surface, an outisde of something 
which Is Infinitely more small. Each part 
of the machine Is yet again an Infinitely 
complex machine. Whereas Descartes, 
and what became known as rational 
thinking, said that if you blow up half of 
this machine very big and you project it 
on the wall, you will suddenly see a 
huge member which Is part of that 
machine and you can touch it and you 
can say that Is the member of that 
machine and there Is nothing else to it 
but Its own characteristics. I think that, 
morally, it creates a very different at· 
Illude and a much greater modesty 
towards nature which Is that there Is 
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feels like a shower going through your 
head and just the mam things remain. 

I think h's very good for architects to 
think. lt creates a modesty which Is very 
Important and which will also reveal 
that we are at a very low level o' cu'ture 
and also of art1stlc sens1bil•t). of 
awareness of what beauty is. Beauty, 
today, Is purely taught as h•storical 
category. lt's removed from tts In· 
strumental value. After all,thesepeop'e 
who wrote about beauty knew that peo­
ple are apt not only to understand what 
beauty Is. but · at an age where the 
awareness of beaU1y vanishes· are able 
to recapture and re-understand what 
beautY Is and !low they can also make 
it. I thin the discourse Is very universal 
and you Shouldn t expect, If you read 
these people, that by tomorro" you 
know. 

And I think m our lifetime there won' t be 
any grea1 architects. lt's not possible. 
There will be no great painters. Because 
great artists can only come after a time 
when the awareness, the Intelligence of 
basic categories 1s so natural that by 
the time you are fifteen years you really 
know hOw to make great art. lt's so 
natural that you don't even question lt . 
Then the~e may be people who come 
and just with a stroke of a brush make 
genial things v.hlch will be remembered 
for another thousand years. 

But now a single Individual wlll not be 
able to do that because we have no art 
ourselves. One can say, of course, there 
are a lot of artists wno produce an and 
they pu• sculptures e-Jerywhere. They 
ma e big build ings therefore one can 
say there is art and archaecture. 
Because there are art1sts and ar· 
chhects, they do not necessarily pro­
duce art and arcnHecture. Today people 
automatically conclude, because there 
are so ma.'ly artists and archhects who 
have even diplomas and the greatest 
achievements as far as Institutional 
evaluation goes, that we are In a great 
artistic epoch. But I think it's qu1te the 
contrary. If you really see a great work 
that just moves you overwhelmingly, 
you may conclude perhaps that there Is 
a great artist behind it. That does not 
mean that that great artist may just 
have had a stroke of luck, you know. 

Today, I think, Is a desperate periOd. My 
wor I ftnd, Is extremely primitive as far 
as artistic values go. I'm not thirty-five. 
lt took me about fifteen years to learn, 
myself, what Is architecture at all· even 
the names of things. If I had to describe 
all the profiles in a column, I couldn't 
describe it like I describe a meat 
although I have now been occupying 
myself with these problems for the last 
fifteen years. You see thiS Incredible 
problem of Intelligence which also 
prevents, then, artistic matunty to ar· 
rlve. 
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had any result, as far as education 
goes, for my students Quite the con· 
trary. My best students reacted very 
strongly against any kind of rational 
teaching. The brightest became really 
crazy artists. lt's very strange. If you 
want to put things right or put things In 
place, you disappoint such huge expec· 
tatlons · which are both social and pro· 
fesslonal. 

Most people become architects or ar· 
tlsts because 1t has a certain social 
value. I'm sure that ninety per cent o f 
people become architects because 
their mother, their father, their grand· 
mother said, become an architect 
because he Is both an artist and In a 
social position where you earn enough 
money bla, bla, bla and you will be con· 
sidered like a priest.' Now, In the last 
thirty years, the profession of architec· 
tu re has changed in Europe from a very 
high prestige to just the bottom of any 
status at all. That If you say for in· 
stance, now In England, that you're an 
architect ... I never say I'm an architect If 
people ask me because people feel 
very·aggressive against architects. 

I was at school In Stuttgart for a few 
months The only thing I found out was 
that everything I was taught was exact· 
ly the contrary of what architecture Is 
and was, truthfully and fundamentally. 
Really, what you are taught Is that you 
will not be able to do this and that and 
therefore you have to be content to do 
just this manner of unpleasant things. 
My brother had to go through school. 
He's much older and he had to do his 
diplomas to satisfy the family and so 
on. BU1 by the time I came Into the 
machine, we were all aware enough that 
that teaching was completely useless 
and also counterproductive, and 
therefore I was able to leave school In 
the first year I just told my parents I 
simply can't go because I would not 
have been able to do the exams. I 
couldn't function in that system. 

I looked for a master. I wanted to learn 
something because by the time you are 
twenty you are fed up, you want to 
know what Is right and what Is wrong. 
And I was then very much still enthused 
by LeCorbusler and Leger and all that 
kind of stuff because lt felt very revolu· 
tlonary, still. I was looking for 
somebody who could teach me and 
then I thought James Stirling was the 
only one who had done something 
which I found really Important or had 
some quality. But when I went there I 
found that he had no security. He was 
jumping from one flower to the other 
and that, virtually, with every project he 
changed his belief. He was designing 
according to very superficial categories 
of Industrial aspect rather than of In· 
dustrlal production, so, In that sense, 
he was still an artist· but without any vi· 
slon of life. Just then he had been com· 
mlssloned to design, I think it was, 



eiQnt hundred or a thousand housing 
units and he didn't know what to do. 
There were about five guys in the office 
who tried for six months to design 
shapes and nobody knew what it really 
was; whether they were court houses. 
yards, gardens, or what even the image 
was or should be. So it was completely 
looking In the darkness for fame. He 
had another good publication and 
that's. really, when I got extremely 
critical and also got in a terrible crisis. I 
told him if somebody so childish, who 
has no theory, gets such a big job· and 
he's the best man I could imagine· what 
are the other big offices doing? How do 
they confront the real problems? 

Then you come to the conclusion that 
this industrial system only creates 
phantom values and phantom 
pressures. You always have to finish a 
certain thing for a certain time. A stu· 
dent, every three months, has to do one 
project. Now, with the artistic and 
techmcal ability we have, it is extremely 
difficult because with every project we 
have to learn virtually everything. 
Whether it is at the scale of designing a 
door or a city. I always found to really 
do something properly, the deadline is 
always too short. And now I've decided, 
because I have some comfort, that I can 
work to the moment I've finished. Even 
if I've won or lost the competition, I 
have to rework it no matter how much 
time. I have now been working on a 
competition I got a small prize for two 
years ago and it is not yet finished. Vir· 
tually everything you draw you have to 
learn. lt's very nice if you have time but 
you can't work on pressure. I don't think 
you produce quality because judge­
ment is so obliterated. That judgement, 
if you don't learn it by the time you are 
fifteen years old, you have to learn it 
just through ... 

I found out a very good system. If you 
are doing a project or a drawing or 
anything, it's very good to hang it on the 
wall to look at it, just always have it 
there. And then when there is 
something which is not right, it will lr· 
ri tate you very shortly. And then you will 
work on it until it won't irritate you. 
That's the dumb way towards beaut y. 
The moment nothing will irritate you, 
you will probably have quite a beautiful 
product because only a beautiful pro· 
duct will leave you completely peaceful, 
I think. 

Judgement is something, I think, you 
can only regain by being very relaxed 
and also very open-minded. Don't think 
about what Leger or what LeCorbusler 
is doing, just look at what the thing is 
worth. Material things, technical things 
become extremely Important for judge· 
ment. And I found out that In school 
this Is completely Impossible If you get 
people who come from the most dif· 
lerent places; from America, from Iran, 
from this and that, with very different 

moral backgrounds. 1t Is comp(etely 
unbelievable, unthinkable that you can 
teach them anything within a year or 
within two years. 

That was also the value of pre-lndustrial 
educating · of education, I would say, 
because I don't think there Is Industrial 
education. it just doesn't exist. it's call· 
ed so, but the results are not every 
educative. But the relationship of the 
master and the pupil was a relationship 
of extreme care and also of love, of 
tenderness, and of great concern. Not 
only for the pupil towards the master 
but also from the master to the pupil. A 
direct human concern. 

I had that chance because my brother 
was much older. So we had a great emo· 
tlonal relationship for a very long time, 
and which lasts on and on, because he 
had to go through hell, virtually, himself 
· or through the first ring of hell. I 
always could avoid. I always had a 
greater comfort after because he had to 
go through this very terrible experience. 
And so we had a very nice relationship 
and I think that is the relationship a 
pupil has to have with a master. lt must 
be extremely of great concern and, 
therefore, one of the great principles of 
the medieval guilds, of those artlsanal ' 
systems of education, was that a 
master must never have more 
employees than he can educate. That Is 
about three or four at one lime and that 
is already a maximum. All the rest is 
dilluslon. 

My brother has now two hundred and 
fifty students In Italy. Some professors 
have a thousand students. lt is com· 
pletely meaningless and the outcome is 
tragic. And, usually, selection Is much 
harsher than even the most elitist 
aristocratic societies because it is 

much more brutal. That equality WhiCh 
we have is not so much equal oppor· 
tunity for everybody, but equal oppor· 
tun lty for everyone to fall and only the 
toughest survive. And then one says, 
'Oh yes, he had the same chance at the 
beginning' and therefore, If they fail , we 
just treat them like human rot . 
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Whereas, I think, a society Which is 
aware of colossal differences will be 
much more sensitive to these dif· 
ferences and have more respect to what 
people can do. Now all of that leads 
towards conclusions which I haven 't 
resolved and which can't poss•bly be 
resolved. But this we have to think very 
strongly about and not be so sure we 
have the best system which has ever 
been invented. That doesn't mean that 
you can't enjoy life colossally. 

Panel: There must be parts of the world 
where industrialization hasn't had any 
effect at all. For instance, in Nepal. Do 
you find here a continuity of an older 
society that is undisturbed and is 
satisfied? 

Krier: The things which escaped in· 
dustrialization, they have escaped only 
for the moment. That is the tragic 
dimension to it. Not any of the highest 
cultures in Europe, or also in China or· 
in other parts of the world, were able to 
confront this industrialization. But eve, 
why Europeans or North Americans. 
why even the dumbest of them, always 
feel superior. that they are the top of 
the world and behave as if they were ... 
Why there is no other culture Which in· 
fuses us with so much respect that we 
would want to imitate it, and why we 
don't want suddenly in Central Europe 
to have Nepalese temples, and why, in 
Nepal, petrol stations and factories 
begin to grow and will finally blast the 
place very quickly, very soon ... 

Industrialization is that kind of invasion 
of life which was not expected and 
because nobody expected the attack 
from this side or that side, nobody 
reacted against it. 

In 1954 in France, somebody signed a 
treaty which led France towards that 
development of nuclear energy which is 
now the most colossal and monumental 
investment in history · when compared, 
the cathedrals or any of the great 
pyramids are nothing. Now, a French 
thinker, Michel Bosquet, who is very 
concerned, tried to find out who was 
responsible for this. So he went from 
one contract to the other, hackwards, to 
find out who made the first signature 
which made the machine develop. And 
he found out that the first contract was 
signed by the then prime minister, 
Pierre Mendes-France. Mendes-France, 
in France, was the only politician who 
had never been involved in Mafia or any 
kind of terrible political maChinations. 
He resigned over Dien Bien Phu. He 
said, ·we can't do that,' and he resigned 
and said, 'I'm unable to take that 
responsibili ty.' And so, he was the 
greatest moral character in French 
politics; and he signed this treaty which 
led to total disaster and I'm sure that 
it's completely out of control. 

In 1954, when you were told about 
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nuclear energy, scientists and technt· 
clans sad this is a great thing of the 
future I saw propaganda films of the 
English nuclear authorities saying, In a 
heroic voice, that in 1960 we will have 
developed so many stations, In 1970 so 
many, and In 1980 electricity will be 
free. And on those reports, which were 
signed by the greatest scientists and 
technicians of the time, political deci­
sions were taken ~ust because they 
believed the scientists. Now they know 
they were wrong and there are some 
scientists who beg m to realize and who 
begln to criticize what they did 
themselVes. But that Is really to say 
:hat In 1954 nobody was capable to be 
critical of the nuclear program because 
nobOdy knew what it was. 

In 1935, nobody in Germany could be 
critical of the motorway because 
nobody knew \\hat 1t was, what tt 
meant. In 1820, nobody could be 
against the railways because nobody 
knew what lt would mean, that it would 
blow all the c1t1es In Europe apart. In· 
dustrlallzation Is always that thing 
which comes towards you and that you 
don't know what it Is. And yet you are 
Incapable to take the moral respon· 
slolllty oecause you don't know what it 
Is, wnat lt will be. 

I mean, If the British Parliament would 
have been told In 1830 • or whenever 
they took their decisions to let this big 
Industry develop as far as public 
transport goes · wnat it would mean 
over a ~ery long period of time, that in a 
hundred years i t will have changed com· 
pletely !le nature ot English cities and 
tnat it would oe a system which lmtlatly 
was profitable but {n the end would de­
mand incredible public funding and 
sacrifice, probably people wou1d have 
said, 'maybe we have to devise now the 
system. Maybe we should just reduce 
trains to luxuries, to develop train lines 
towards spas so people can have 
healthier lives and drank good wa:er.' So 
If you want to be a good Industrialist, 
you have to think of something which 
has not been there and nobody expects. 
lt's very easy because you just have to 
think In a certain way and then you will 
win. 

I mean, ttle man whO Invented Muzak · 
this music which goes on and on and on 
and has no structure, no beginning, no 
end, no high, no bottom, no middle, no 
section, notttlng: It's just complete con· 
fusion of music - ne discovered 
something which Is now so present that 
nobody even notices Jt. lt's In hotels, 
ft's In houses, it's everywnere. AAd yet it 
Is nothing lt has no structure. And, ln­
dustnally, it was the best thing to pro­
mote. These things which have no limit. 
which are completely expandible, which 
can be spread out everywhere without 
anybody noticing • that Is the nature, 
the fundamental structure of our time. 
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because they are Identical to each 
other, they have no Identity. They have 
only been called Mach 11 or Ford Caprl, 
but you can't distinguish one Ford 
Caprl from another In terms of the pro· 
ductlon. And that Is what I think Is fun· 
damentally against nature and al so 
what will take colossal revenge on what 
we are doing because we created a 
world which Is not real, which Is com· 
pletely abstract. 

Panel: How do you, as c losely as you 
can, define Industrialization? The term 
means many thlr.gs to many people. 
Certainly, a long t ime ago, before the in· 
dustrial world, people were reproducing 
things, they were making a lot of stones 
to build wlth. 

Krler: You can define it as the develop· 
ment of a means of product Ion lndepen· 
dent of an Immediate need If that 
develops towards a complete in· 
dependence 1t also develops a com· 
pletely autonomous system of produc· 
lion and it creates work which Is ex· 
tremely unpleasant. it's a unlversallza. 
tlon of toiling. 

I think Hannah Arendt Is very important. 
She distinguished three categories of 
work: body work, manual work, and In· 
tellectual work. Artistic work Is that 
form of production which allows an 
Ideal combination of manual and in· 
tellectual . The physical exercise is ex­
tremely pleasant and yet. you produce 
objects which have a lasting value, ob­
jects of use which outlast a generation 
and which have a kind of permanence. 

Now, artlsanal work. craftwork, was 
that manual work which was also hrghly 
pleasant • and I know 1t because my 
father is a tailor, and the only problems 
he had were with the government, who 
were just destroying his firm through 
overtaxation and so on. But I still ex· 
perlenced a place where there were 
about ten people working in very great 
human oondltlons which were extreme· 
ly pleasant, which showed, by the way, 
that these people were very good 
friends In the way they were talking. lt's 
a very quiet way of production. So, 
craftsmanship Is a form of production 
where you make necessary objects of 
use with pleasure. 

Hannah Arendt makes the fundamental 
difference between objects of use and 
objects of consumption Objects of 
consumption are those you oonsume 
Immediately like an apple or anything 
the metabolism needs for Immediate 
survival and reconstruction. Objects of 
use are those with which you build the 
human world . They are artificial objects 
but which create a world which Is 
human. She said that human beings are 
basically alien to nature. They can't live 
In nature. They have to build their own 
objects. We are not like cats. 



Now, craftwork Is that work which Is ex· 
tremely pleasant but which Is also very 
comfortable. You don't have great pro· 
blema of creativity because lt Is work, 
really, for private use. lt has no great 
public status. Whereas art Is really 
public. lt creates values which are 
public values which everybody admires 
because they reach a higher degree of 
awareness of our condition, I think, and 
also of beauty, of solidity. 

Whereas toll ing, she says, Is purely 
body work, where pleasure, virtually, 
doesn't come Into account, like 
primitive forms of agriculture. Sheer 
physical work like digging out graves. 

Industrialization Is that condition where 
unpleasant work becomes the universal 
condition of all human production. But 
even now, In the condition of In· 
d ust rl allzatlon , artists subject 
themselves, without being asked, to 
that Industrial alienation. Then you 
have artists who do these most 
alienating works of art· what are called 
'works of art' · In which you see that the 
man can't have had pleasure, because 
it's so abstract and something so 
minimal, as far as intellectual Invest· 
ment goes, that lt couldn't have been 
done with pleasure. And yet, she says · 
not only her, she does an analysts of 
other occldental thinkers · that a work 
of art can only exist If lt has been done 
with pleasure, because pleasure and 
beauty are extremely linked. There can 
be no beauty which Is not conceived 
somewhere In pleasure. Sometimes it 
takes pain, but even pain can be very 
close to pleasure. But lt's completely 
di fferent from industrial work where 
you go everyday to a place where you 
know they are going to tear your guts 
and your brains out. And if you go 
through that for thirty years, you are not 
a human being anymore. You have 
never developed the capacities which 
you have been given by nature. 

Industrialization Is that stage where 
this unpleasantness becomes the 
universal condition · although it's un· 
necessary. All the excuses which one 
brings up with demographic explosion 
are not true because European society 
has not grown demographically In the 
last thirty years. lt has reached an ab· 
solute top. So there would be the 
possibility of now Installing structures 
which would create objects which 
would have a greater permanence. Yet 
the contrary Is being done. Objects of 
use are more and more being taken over 
by Industry and becoming objects of 
consumption. So you do not only con· 
sume pears and bread but you consume 
now entire cities. 

If you go to places like St. Louis, you 
see that that city Is being completely 
consumed. it doesn't exist anymore. 1t 
la complete ruin. You can drive for 
hours and hours diagonally and crlss· 

cross the city and it is just an eternal 
wasteland like Detroit, like the Bronx In 
New York and so on. Yet, twenty m•les 
from there, one Is building a completely 
new city. But In twenty years that place 
will also be a place of total devastation 

And that Is a tragic dimension because 
now an average single generation has 
to do work which can only be done by 
several generations. That Is why it 
becomes extremely superiflclal or 
unpleasant and why it also becomes 
unbearable for the next generation to 
see; because If something is done with 
shoddiness, it can't have permanence. 
You can make the most solid structure, 

lt will not be permanent if it has not 
beauty because nobody will be in· 
terested to keep it. 

Now, one of the tragic situations is that 
you can have today the most beautiful 
object and because of the moral in· 
capacity of people to judge, they don't 
even see anymore what is beautiful. 
You can tear down the most beautiful 
buildings and replace them by the 
greatest nonsense, as far as art and 
aesthetics go. You have criteria of 
urgency or necessity ... that is where, 
really, people have lost their senses. 
Where they have become blinded and 
unable to smell or really judge what Is 
pleasant. 

Panel: What did the public think of your 
Luxembourg counter-proposal? How 
did lt go? 

Krler. 1t was great because Culot had 
organized a fantastic publicity cam· 
palgn. Luxembourg is a very small 
place . 300,000 inhabitants · but it Is 
very complex. lt has about six daily 
papers. can you Imagine? Just 300,000 
people. it's a country which has cities. 
which has a beautiful landscape, which 
has mountains, and which has plains 1t 
has everything. it's like a miniature 
world. And so, when you do something 
you Immediately reach everybodY. You 
can organize a press conference and 
the whole of the press is there. And 
because they really love writing about 
things, you give them a text and they 
just change the commas. So they filled 
the papers for a few weeks. 
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it was a fantastic occasion. it was a 
great reward for my toll ing because 
there waa no one who disagreed. ' it's 
the right thing. What should one do? 
How can you proceed? What's the next 
step?' I said, ' I just offer you a solution. 
What to do about it, I don't know. I'm 
not a politician. I'm not a developer. 1 
just offer you Instruments.' 

I occasionally go back every two years 
to do a few lectures and I think it 
creates an awareness that not 
e~erythlng Is right, now, but that there 
are disasters which are each and 
anybody's responsibility and that 
maybe one can bring a crisis to a boil· 
lng point where they ask who can 
resolve lt. And so , I would offer my ser­
vices to do that. 

I think most people agreed because I 
just confirmed what they were saying. 
The only thing I tried to do was prove 
that people were right In their feelings, 
however stupid their argument. They 
said, 'Tallllbert, it's Inhuman.' it's not 
an argument which has value because 
then three other specialists say, 'No, 
it's the only thing which is now human. 
it's progressive. lt's liberty. it's creatlvl· 
ty. it's everyth ing.' So I just tried to pro­
ve, with what they had, why they were 
right to say this Is wrong, because they 
didn't know how to articulate lt. By com­
paring to the existing situation which Is 
beautiful and which they are losing. But 
If that situation Is beautiful, it's not 
because it' s natural to have a beautiful 
environment, but because thet'e have 
been so many generations· Who cared 
for and who were extremely sensitive 
and Intelligent and also made the 
greatest effort to build up this envlron· 
ment. Now, If we take that for granted, 
it's to our own disadvantage because if 
we don't respect it. it will have disap­
peared In two generations and then 
there will be nothing left. And then it's 
even worse than starting from scratch 
because we are so alienated and so far 
away from any good sense that, I think, 
it's something which Is completely 
without issue, without possible positive 
outcome. 

The populist approach Is also a very 
dangerous one because If you take peo­
ple's judgement as the supreme judge­
ment... If an architect Is a good ar· 
chltect, or If a town planner is a good 
town planner, there Is no need for peo­
ple to protest because he does his job 
well and people respect him and he will 
earn a lot of money and he will be 
remembered. That has been done with 
all the great architects and artists and 
they are venerated like gods, almost. 
But If you are a bad artist and you pre­
tend to be a good one, you can make a 
lot of money but you will be punished by 
a bad conscience and by disrespect 
and by a lack of comfort In the society .. 
We are still, now, at the moment where 
people realize that something has gone 
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wrong, but they are not yet capable to 
Judge wtlat should be done. 

We sent to all politicians a book ex· 
plain log all the elements of the analysis 
and of the prorect. What could be done. 
And lt's extremely simple to do because 
lt could be done by political dec1slons 
which don't Involve disappointing 
anybody. No exproprlatlons. Nothing. it 
doesn't hurt anybody. 

Town planning and archttecture is 
something which creates values. 11 you 
use that human labor to bu lid 
something beautiful and something 
solid, it 11 be a value. lt will be a real 
value WhiCh has not existed beiore. lt 
w111 be a new value and that value will 
have a certain permanence if it Is 
beautiful, solid and comfortable. All the 
good classical objectives . li you don't 
do that, lt will have none of these 
qualities and you wfll lose values. But 
-that will la! e time fOf people to realize. 
Or even If they don't realize, it will be 
too bad. 

But now the situation has become so 
ridiculous that people disbelieve ar· 
chltects and tn Europe there's a huge 
demand for participation. People say, 
'Because architects are so bad, we 
want to participate,' and they form com· 
mlttees and they want to have a say. 
And so, an architect, wtlo wants to do 
anything nowadays in a European city, 
has to present his profect to big com· 
mlttees a.'1Cl even the butcher has a say. 
The same say. They can say, No I don't 
like this", or ' I want my car park here.' 
That's total Babe!. lt's complete confu· 
slon. 

lt' s impossible to thtnk In a committee. 
If we were to think here about 
somethmg, we Y.'OUid have to go back, 
each of us, and think and ;hen maybe 
we could come out wl:h something In· 
telligent, and present ft. A comrmttee 
cannot possibly do something wnich Is 
intelligent and yet these participation 
rounds claim that they are going to 
create a better env1ronment. 

If engineers were unable to build 
alrplanes that fly, committees would 
not be able to resolve the problem. 
Committees will say engineers are 
wrong because they build airplanes 
which fa11 down or which can't fly, and 
then there would be a demand for par­
ticipation. But there Is no demand 
because engineers build airptanes 
which fly. So If architects make houses 
which are real houses, there wouldn't 
be any need for participation. And, alter 
all, we look bac · on a few thousand 
years of architeeturat culture, of the 
haghest c.chievements of an and ar· 
chltecture. So someone should be able 
to do something but ••. 

Panel: Ooe thing you magnt explain. 
because there may be a misconception 

about it, Is how do you spend your 
time? 

Krlar.l had to leave teaching because of 
my health. lt made me very Ill and I got 
very bad headaches. The doctOf' said 
whenever you get that sort of thing 
there's something wrong with your 
work. When I told him I was teaching. 
he told me to just give up teaching. I 
told him that lt was. •:1e only thing I earn· 
ad my money from. He said give up 
teaching or have ulcers, so I gave that 
up. 

I had a lot of projects for authorities in 
Germany, and In France, too, which 
earned a bit of money. Because I do 
things myself, alone, I don't have any 
problems with people. I don't have 
dlscusslons. I just do things until 
they're right and all by myself. it's very 
easy because an Individual can do most 
of the things which are required 
nowadays from a planner. Just by doing 
lt peacefully. it's Interesting because 
you can earn a lot of money which 
otherwise Is lost In big office problems 
and teamwork. lt is a colossal 
fJBSp/llage, teamwork, because you 
waste so much energy In just bringing 
human differences together or Ironing 
them out, that they're counterproduc· 
tlve. lt's enough If I do a project every 
two years which earns me some money 
so I can live. Usually I work on it for six 
months so I can live for two years. it's 
very pleasant. But before that, I usually 
put the conditions so that my WOfk will 
be accepted for what it Is. 

Usually you find enough people who are 
In authority · and usually it's ad· 
mlnlstraiOf'S and politicians · who have 
great awareness of the catastrophe we 
are In. They don't have any Illusions 
because they have nothing to excuse 
themselves for. They don't have terrible 
drawings they did twenty years ago that 
they had to burn. So they know exactly 
when art Is just useless, or when ar· 
chltecture Is bad, because they see 
with very cold eyes. So these people are 
very ohen quite rational and they go 
along, If you really argue something 
very rationally. There are many projects 
where I demonstrated to the local 
senate Of' the authority of a new town 
that they were fundamentally wrong 
and that my project was right. So they 
had to agree. They had to pay me. And 
yet they say, ·we are sorry. You are 
right. We will pay you but we can't build 
your stuff although you are right. We 
know you are right." 

I had one very big project In France for a 
school and I needed a budoet which 
would have been about double to build 
it decently. If you wanted to build the 
materlala I presented, lt would have 
been two hundred percent lllOfe ex pen· 
alve. Which Is not very much because, 
after all, Tallllbort, hta budgets go over 
two thousand times. But If you want to 
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do something reasonable, lt's very dif· 
flcult to ally the great amount of the 
people because people understand lt 
and therefore they say, 'Oh, but we 
can't have this.' If you mystify the pro· 
btem, you say this must be so expensive 
because of this and that and Inflation ... 
If you don't have the truth you will unify 
people behind you. Just by lying. But I 
don't want to get Involved with these 
problems because I won't survive just 
healthwlse. 

I found out that a very good comblna· 
tlon of working Is writing and drawing 
because I usually get very angry when I 
do a project and then I can write very 
well aher. Culot commissioned me to 
do a series of books and I concentrated 
and I haven't done any drawings in two 
years. I got so frustrated because 
writing· the sort of writing which I want 
to do · Is already something more 
abstract than drawing because drawing 
may be an abstract thing • it's two 
dimensional · but it's very much related 
to the real world. Whereas philosophy Is 
the highest degree of abstraction and 
universality and if you don't have a col· 
ossally gifted mind for that 1t leads you 
to terrible frustration. And I just had to 
learn for two years how to write. And I 
found out that the combination of draw­
Ing and writing is a good combination. 

Panel: What sort of books are they? 

Krler. They're called The Six Books of 
Reconstruction which also try to link 
the idea of reconstruction to 
philosophy and science and to situate 
architecture In a very broad moral land· 
scape. I found out that the work I did 
ten years ago was still very abstract 
because what I drew I was learning. I 
could only draw things which I had 
understood; so, I couldn't draw a cor· 
nice because I didn't know how it was 
built and what it was there for. I didn't 
know what a modillion meant or where 
an ovolo motif came from and what it 
really signified. So, now, my projects 
have become more and more real and to 
do these books I will rework old pro­
jects. They won't be changed but I will 
just add the things which have been 
missing and maybe sometimes even ex· 
plain why this has been done so. 

The books are extremely simple. 
They' re like school books and they ex· 
plain how the system works from the 
smallest part to the larger. it's rational. 
Rationalism really came about In the 
eighteenth, nineteenth century when 
the world was already falling that much 
apart that some people thought the on· 
ly way to keep it together was to gather 
knowledge in some form, so that it's 
possible to learn not from direct em· 
pirical experience, but just by taking 
books. With books you are able to 
recapture all this knowledge. But lt Is 
already a great simplification of the 
moral and sensuous world of feeling ... 


